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Revisiting America after a three years ab-

sence, and lecturing on my twelve years in the 
Soviet Union, I was struck by a significant in-
crease in would-be intelligent questions about 
dictatorship in government. “How can three 
million Communists rule one hundred and 
sixty million people?” is the simplest form the 
question takes. It may be accompanied by en-
vious wonder at Communist cleverness, or by 
a sophisticated fling at Stalin — “just another 
Hitler!” It may show the superiority of the in-
tellectual climber, aware that dictatorships are 
the mode today. Often it implies some aloof-
ness of America, not to be caught in the nets of 
Europe. “Those backward Russians, those 
quarrelsome Europeans may need dictator-
ships; but we will make our changes democrat-
ically.” 

“Dictatorship versus democracy” is a uni-
versal subject of lectures, debates, editorials, 
magazine articles in the United States. It has 
even become a question of practical politics, 
and Americans are discussing politics as they 
have not done for years. The rise of Hitler, the 
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growth of other fascist dictatorships, full-
fledged or implicit, the appearance of a strong-
man policy in Washington, loyally cheered by 
those folk who most use the democratic slo-
gan-all this has brought the problem to the 
fore. The usual lecture on this theme puts on 
the one side Stalin, Hitler, Mussolini — all dic-
tators, to be contrasted with democracy actual 
or hoped for. It seeks to raise the flattering an-
tithesis of “dictatorship” with “democracy” to 
avoid the truer and more annoying contrast of 
the Soviet Union with the capitalist world. 

When I hear these lectures and debates on 
dictatorship and democracy, I sense a deep 
misunderstanding of the facts. For though the 
USSR is by definition a dictatorship, it is not 
what these lecturers imply by the term. It is 
marked by a far wider participation of masses 
in the daily tasks of governing, and by a far 
more flexible inclusion of millions of individ-
ual wills than either the parliamentary forms 
derived from last century or the more medieval 
rule to which Hitler makes return. 

I think of millions of ordinary folk giving 
time to the job of governing, on housing com-
missions, taxing commissions, social insurance 
commissions, investigating commissions. 
“Planning” starts on winter evenings in the 
snow-bound rural village, or after working 
hours in sessions of foundry hands and forge 
men. I think of the hundreds of new ideas in 
government that begin in a Ukrainian town-
ship or a Ural steel mill or a Central Asia cot-
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ton gin, and that sweep the country through 
mass acceptance to universal adoption. I re-
member hundreds of men and women in gov-
ernment office, factory manager, inspector or 
judge, rising steadily from the masses through 
years of voluntary government work in which 
millions take part, and always keeping touch 
with some farm or factory through which they 
interpret and lead the will of the mass. I think 
of the proud words of a small official in Mol-
vitino township: “Why should we ask Ko-
stroma (capital of the province)? Haven’t we a 
Soviet Power of our own?”— and the testimony 
they bear to local initiative and rule. 

I shall therefore content myself with con-
crete reporting on items of daily life in the So-
viet Union, which show how our life here is 
governed. Knowing such facts is of vital im-
portance in judging the methods of govern-
ment today. 

The Drive on the Kulaks 
Let us seize the sharpest horns of the bull 

at once: that exiling in recent years of perhaps 
a million kulaks (the better-to-do peasants 
who exploited hired labour) from their rural 
homes in European Russia and Ukraine to Si-
beria and the northern woods. Here is an ac-
tion which caused in America wide comment. 
What was the process? How was it carried on? 

The usual assumption outside the Soviet 
Union is that this exiling occurred through 
drastic action by a mystically omnipotent 
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GPU. The actual process was quite different; it 
was done by village meetings of poor peasants 
and farmhands which listed those kulaks who 
“impede the collective farm by force and vio-
lence” and asked the government to deport 
them. In the hot days of 1930 I attended sev-
eral of these meetings. They were harsh, ruth-
less discussions, analysing one by one the 
“best families,” which had grabbed the best 
lands, exploited labour by owning the tools of 
production, as “best families” normally and 
historically do, and who were now fighting the 
rise of the collective farms by arson, cattle-kill-
ing and murder. Meetings of poor peasants and 
farmhands discussed them, questioned them, 
passed on them, allowing some to remain but 
listing others as “dangerous to our peaceful de-
velopment — should be deported from our vil-
lage.” 

It was a harsh, bitter and by no means 
bloodless conflict. I was reminded of it again 
in the San Joaquin Valley of California by the 
cotton pickers’ strike in the autumn of 1933. 
The same gradations from half-starved farm-
hand to wealthy rancher, though the extremes 
in California were wider. California local au-
thorities permitted deportation of pickets who 
interfered with farming of private ranchers; So-
viet authorities permitted deportation of ku-
laks who interfered with the collectively owned 
farms of poor peasants and labourers. In both 
cases the central government sent investigating 
commissions, slightly moderating and there-
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with sanctioning the local actions. The gover-
nor’s commission in California threw out a few 
of the most untenable cases against strikers. In 
the USSR the township and provincial com-
missions reviewed the lists of “kulaks for ex-
ile” and greatly cut them down, guarding 
against local spites and excesses. But the active 
winning will which could count on the backing 
of government was in California the will of 
ranchers and finance corporations; in the 
USSR the will of organized farmhands. That, 
in its simplest essence, is “proletarian dictator-
ship.” 

Power in the Hands of Workers 
Certain fundamental matters in the Soviet 

Union are held to have been settled by the Rev-
olution and incorporated in the constitution of 
the country; on them, no debate either tends to 
arise or would be permitted. The power is in 
the hands of all who work and only these have 
a voice in government. They use this power to 
operate the means of production for joint ben-
efits. The most active participants in power are 
therefore those workers who are organized 
around the modern complex tools of produc-
tion, the big industrial establishments and the 
large-scale mechanized farms. Such organized 
workers, steadily holding power, will train new 
generations who will cooperate freely through 
economic and social forms to achieve by sci-
ence the advancing conquest of nature. This is 
the theory assumed behind all life in the Soviet 
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Union. 
But if no debate regarding this general path 

of development takes place save as it is elabo-
rated by philosophers and theoreticians, there 
is no lack of vital problems in daily govern-
ment. Joseph Stalin brought out this point in 
his interview with the First American labour 
Delegation, on September 9, 1927. In answer-
ing a question he declared: “You speak of a 
conflict of opinion among the workers and 
peasants at the present time, under the prole-
tarian dictatorship. I have said already that 
conflict of opinion exists and will exist in the 
future, that no progress is possible without 
this, but conflict of opinion among the workers 
under present conditions centres, not around 
the question of the overthrow of the Soviet sys-
tem in principle, but around practical ques-
tions like the improvement of the Soviets, the 
rectification of errors committed by the Soviet 
organs and, consequently, of consolidating So-
viet rule.” (Interview With Foreign Workers 
Delegations, by Joseph Stalin, International 
Publishers.) 

Under what form shall social ownership be 
manifested, municipal, federal, or voluntary 
cooperative? Which industries are better han-
dled by state-appointed managers? Which by 
small groups of workers selecting their own 
management? What relation shall exist be-
tween various forms of socially owned produc-
tion, between city and rural districts? What rel-
ative attention shall be given to each of a thou-
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sand factories, trades, localities? Over this 
daily stuff of government, discussion and 
struggle goes on — and change and experi-
ment. 

Month by month in the past 12 years I have 
seen campaigns and continuous efforts to 
“draw wide popular masses” into these gov-
erning tasks. “Every kitchen maid must learn 
to rule the state”; this slogan of Lenin served 
as a clarion call to millions of suppressed, illit-
erate women in the decade gone by. If “eternal 
vigilance is the price of liberty,” and vigilance 
relaxed is a source of “democracy’s” woes, 
then eternal participating activity is the price 
of a socialist order, and it is a harder task. Fac-
tory hands, housewives, longshoremen, farm 
labourers, office workers, the great working 
masses — had to be stirred, prodded, energized 
into active part in rule. They are taking such 
part — and widely; all our troubles arise when 
they slacken. 

Government Begins at the Work 

Bench 
The first and most essential governing 

tasks in the USSR start at the workers’ bench. 
Here took form the Five-Year Plan that star-
tled the world. Production meetings after work 
discuss shop problems, what holds back pro-
duction, how much it can be increased, granted 
certain raw materials, machines and skilled 
personnel, for the coming year. These discus-
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sions are enlarged on a factory scale; they go 
up from factory to the central offices of the 
trust. Word comes down to the shop again that 
the country needs certain new machines. Can 
we make them in our plant? And here workers’ 
invention and suggestion widen to include a 
nation’s plans. Delegates from other industries 
which need the machines arrive, explain, mu-
tually consult. 

For a socialist state this is the simplest, 
most basic act of government; workers plan-
ning expansion and improvement of their pub-
licly owned properties. The biggest basic 
plants, supplying equipment on which the rest 
of the land depends — steel works, auto works, 
locomotive works, mines — become naturally 
known as “political centres.” I can pick them 
out in Moscow: Electric Works, Auto Works, 
Ball-Bearing Works, Aviation Works, and oth-
ers. From these centres arise new ideas, new 
policies for the nation’s growth; before any 
new policy is seriously considered, wide sam-
pling takes place of workers’ opinion in these 
centres. When any policy is put through, the 
active force for carrying it into being consists 
of the workers in such centres and other work-
ers organized around them. 

Political life in rural districts starts around 
the use of the land. Sixty peasants in council — 
the collective farm of a small village — meet 
with the representative of the township land 
department or the farm expert from the tractor 
station to draw up their “farm plan.” Number 
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of households, of people, of horses, ploughs, 
tractors, extent and type of land must be in-
cluded. The plan must take account of the little 
community’s food and fodder needs, the past 
crop rotations, the marketable crop recom-
mended by the state for their locality. Certain 
general directions come down from the central 
Commissariat of Agriculture, filtered through 
the provincial land offices and adapted to their 
region: a two percent increase in grain or a rise 
in industrial crops is asked for. The sixty peas-
ants in council consider by what concrete 
means they will expand or rearrange their 
fields for all these purposes; discussion after 
discussion takes place all winter through till 
the “plan” is accomplished. Consciously they 
are settling problems of government on which 
countrywide, province-wide, nation-wide 
plans will be based. 

From this simple economic base all other 
tasks of government begin. In every task, plan-
ning, execution, checking, these masses take 
part. Taxing and housing commissions, social 
insurance commissions, sanitary commissions, 
complaint commissions — are carried on by 
unpaid labour millions, served by secretarial 
work of a smaller number of full-time officials. 
Driving along a country road fifty miles from a 
railway I see four women on a shady bench 
poring over a ledger — a rural tax commission 
revaluing village property for report to the vil-
lage assembly. A few miles further is a district 
court, holding travelling session under the 
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trees; it has drawn two local peasants in to 
serve as co-judges. Moscow decrees a passport 
system for its citizens and opens scores of of-
fices for listing, investigating, checking; the 
work is largely done by teachers, office work-
ers, factory workers, women on old age pen-
sions emerging to do their bit in government. 
They call it “doing social work”; every worker 
and office employee is urged to do it; every fac-
tory prides itself by the number of its workers 
who take voluntary part in government. 

Foreign Workers Participate 
Even foreigners residing in the Soviet Un-

ion are asked to take part in government. 
When there were three hundred Americans 
employed in the Stalingrad Tractor Works, the 
urging of the Russians finally induced them to 
elect two of their number to sit on the Stalin-
grad City Soviet. “Someone must be there to 
explain your situation and needs and the 
American ideas about the Tractor Plant,” ran 
the argument. All minority groups of workers 
are similarly urged, that every shade of desire 
and knowledge may be combined in the “pub-
lic will.” “Majority rule” is far too crude a form 
of government for running the intricacies of 
modern industry; majorities and also all signif-
icant minorities must be included; discussion 
and analysis must then take place till unanim-
ity is reached. 

Last autumn the Moscow Committee of 
the Communist Party declared a special drive 
of housing investigation, that workers’ housing 
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might be in order before winter should set in. 
Investigating brigades were organized around 
every large shop and factory, i.e., every “polit-
ical centre.” The task of these brigades was to 
inspect and report on conditions in their as-
signed blocks or apartment houses. The “For-
eign Workers Brigade” of the Stalin Auto 
Workers, consisting of Americans and Ger-
mans employed in the automobile industry, 
won for itself brief prominence for its excellent 
work in housing investigation and especially 
for carrying the fight through various munici-
pal offices till certain abuses were righted. No-
body objected to the foreigners’ intrusion; all 
Russians with whom they came in contact were 
pleased and excited that “foreigners also take 
part in our social work”; they gave them, in 
fact, quite special attention. These men were 
engaged in factory work during the day, and 
the abuses noted were not in their own apart-
ments; but they, with thousands of workers 
like them, gave evening work to housing in-
spection which resulted not only in immediate 
correction of certain abuses but in certain 
changes in municipal instructions on housing. 

This is the normal way in which changes of 
law and new regulations are made in the Soviet 
Union, through investigations made by large 
organized masses of energetic citizens, from 
which conditions become evident and new 
ideas emerge. This is also the process whereby 
yesterday’s backward farmhands and factory 
workers become today’s participants in volun-
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tary government commissions and graduate 
perhaps as tomorrow’s full-time judges, county 
officials and commissars. Practically all of the 
new government officials are drawn from men 
and women who have served considerable ap-
prenticeships in unpaid government or social 
work. 

Full-Time Work and “Social Work” 
It is of course not unusual for workers in 

other countries to rise by diligence and the 
votes of their fellows to minor political jobs. 
The difference lies in the intimate relation they 
still sustain in the USSR to the masses from 
which they rose. There is no hard and fast line 
between full-time officials and the millions 
who give varying amount of voluntary “social 
work.” A worker-citizen may divide his time in 
a score of different ways. A textile worker, 
showing ability in the voluntary work of super-
vising the factory day nursery, may rise to part-
time post as assistant chief of Motherhood and 
Infancy in the City Health Department without 
thereby ceasing her work at the loom. A man 
whose financial ability is practised as volun-
teer dues collector for his trade union may ac-
quire a halftime paid job as assistant chief of 
the city tax department, while still continuing 
his regular day-time job. If the secondary job 
becomes the first and the worker leaves his 
bench for permanent work as city official, there 
is no change in social status. There may not 
even be a change in salary, for city officials’ 
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wages may be either above or below that of a 
skilled worker. Usually there will be no sharp 
withdrawal from his factory. He who once did 
government work in spare time will now return 
to the factory for “social work” in its night 
school or young folks’ organizations. This dou-
bling of factory work with government posts is 
not caused merely by shortage of skilled per-
sonnel. It is a conscious policy of keeping close 
connection between workers and government. 
If workers who take no part in governing are 
rated lazy and backward, government officials 
who do no work in factory or farm organiza-
tions are considered “alien from the masses.” 
These are the everyday relations of “proletar-
ian dictatorship.” 

As a result of this wide diffusion of govern-
ment activity among the masses, initiative in 
government is very decentralized. The hun-
dreds of new ideas and methods that are yearly 
adopted start locally from the experience of a 
million men. So started the “socialist competi-
tions” from the “subbotniks” (volunteer social 
work on holidays); so they developed into 
many forms of mutual stimulation of labour, 
some of them first arising in mining districts, 
some in factories. So began, in the autumn of 
1933 in North Caucasus, the plan for organiz-
ing the old men of the rural districts, who had 
been somewhat disconsolately crowded to the 
rear by youthful organizers of farm collectives, 
as “inspectors of quality” for the joint-owned 
farm. It was a brilliant local idea which will 
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doubtless spread to other regions, since it gives 
these older men a task not only honourably fit-
ted to their experience, but one which the Sec-
ond Five Year Plan declares is of the highest 
importance to the nation. 

Last spring in visiting Ivanovo district, a 
night’s ride northeast of Moscow, I learned of 
an “international congress on farm methods” 
which had taken place the previous year on the 
initiative of the farmers of this province, hardly 
noticed in the Moscow press. Yet delegates 
from France, Germany and China had at-
tended, and had left behind them gorgeously 
embroidered banners to be used as prizes for 
farming records within this single province. 
The number of such acts of local initiative is 
endless; the central Moscow newspapers, espe-
cially Izvestia and Pravda, have scores of re-
porters travelling the country just to collect 
them and publish them, that good ideas and 
methods may spread from district to district, 
often leaping two thousand miles through the 
agency of the newspaper, and sometimes, if 
they meet wide response, becoming “all-un-
ion” methods. 

Function of the Party 
If all this widely scattered and varied initi-

ative of the masses is not to be dissipated in 
conflicting endeavours but to carry the whole 
economic and social life of the country forward 
in the desired direction fixed by the October 
Revolution — there must be a central core of 
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continuously acting people to stimulate, corre-
late and guide. This is the function of the Com-
munist Party, to organize and lead the masses. 
It is not an antagonistic group set over against 
the masses, “three million people ruling a re-
calcitrant hundred and sixty million,” as is of-
ten pictured abroad. It is rather the most ener-
getic part of that hundred and sixty million, the 
ones who pledge their time to the public tasks 
of creating a new social and economic system, 
and who make this the continuing and domi-
nant effort of their lives. 

A member of the Communist Party be-
comes such not only through his own selection, 
but by the approval of the working class among 
whom he lives and toils. Not only must he 
come with recommendations from older Party 
members of from five to ten years standing, but 
recommendations taken so seriously that a 
member may be expelled for endorsing an un-
worthy candidate. Not only must he undergo a 
period of probation ranging from one to two 
years, but admission may be refused, or a 
member once admitted may be expelled not 
only by the judgement of other Communists, 
but in response to accusations from non-party 
workers as well. The list of offences for which 
expulsion is possible includes not merely “al-
ien elements, double-dealers, breakers of dis-
cipline, moral degenerates, careerists, self-
seekers,” but even “passive elements who do 
not carry out their duties and who have not 
mastered the program, rules and most im-
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portant decisions of the party.” 
Members of the party are expected to be 

leaders, interpreting and leading the will of the 
working masses. That the party has plenty of 
“yes-men” and careerists is merely saying that 
it is an organization composed of human be-
ings. Steady, consistent efforts are made to im-
prove the quality of membership and to weed 
out through the periodical “cleansings” the un-
fit material. It is the common requirement 
made of all applicants for membership in the 
Communist Party who may be engaged in in-
tellectual or office work, that they spend a year 
or two in “social work” in some large factory, 
before even making their application for mem-
bership, and are judged by the workers’ view 
of their capacity to lead. A member who ceases 
to interpret and lead the workers around him, 
or who has merely become passive in this task, 
may be disciplined up to the point of rejection 
from the party. And this may happen not only 
to individual members, but to whole “city com-
mittees” if a situation develops which shows 
that they have failed to interpret and lead the 
masses. 

Members of the party have their regular 
jobs by which they earn their living; they may 
be machine hands or People’s Commissars. 
But their unpaid job as party members takes 
precedence of every other work, and of all fam-
ily relations. At the very least they must expect 
to give several evenings a week to routine 
“party work,” in some of the multitudinous, 
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unexciting tasks of organizing masses in indus-
try and government. This may be some dull job 
like collecting trade union dues, assembling 
material for a wall newspaper, checking up 
subscriptions to government loans; it may also 
include leading groups of youth or teaching 
classes in politics. Besides this routine “party 
work” a Communist is ever on call for mobili-
zation to some distant province far from home 
and friends. In any new factory, if Communists 
are lacking, some will be sent there; some ma-
chine hands, engineers and office workers will 
be ordered to leave old established jobs for this 
frontier outpost that there may be a group of 
Communists there to lead the workers in the 
direction fixed by the “party line.” 

Creating the Collective Will 
For it is not enough to interpret the will of 

the masses, as a ballot might or a showing of 
hands. It is not enough to analyse what the 
“majority want” and give it to them. It is the 
Communist’s job to lead, to create collective 
will. Certainly, no group of unurged soldiers 
would ever vote to storm a trench; and cer-
tainly, the workers and peasants of the Soviet 
Union would not have voted unurged, unled, 
for the hardships of these past five years of 
rapid industrialization taken out of their own 
food and comforts, for the painful speed of col-
lectivization without adequate machines or or-
ganizers. But when the Communist Party ana-
lysed, urged and demanded, showing the world 
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situation and the need of making the Soviet 
Union well prepared industrially and for de-
fence, showing the enemy classes who must be 
abolished, showing the goal of a socialist state 
and the hard road to its achievement, they were 
able to find, organize and create, deep in the 
heart of the masses, a will that carried through. 

Let me take a simple example of Com-
munist leadership, from a rural district some 
five hundred miles northeast of Moscow, 
which I chanced to visit in the sowing season 
of 1933. Molvitino township (if one may thus 
roughly translate the administrative unit called 
“rayon” which was in this case some forty 
miles square) lies fifty miles from the railroad. 
In pre-war days its largely illiterate peasants 
lived by insufficient farming in a swampy, hilly 
region, supplemented by sweatshop cap-mak-
ing. “Their agriculture has broken down; the 
cap-makers are mostly tubercular,” wrote 
Lenin of Molvitino in his Development of Cap-
italism in Russia at the end of the last century. 

Last year, for the first time in two genera-
tions, Molvitino produced adequate bread to 
feed its people. It produced in addition an ex-
port crop of flax. For a year and a half it has 
held the banner in Ivanovo province as “first 
in sowing and harvest.” Of its 55,000 popula-
tion, nearly one-third were going to school last 
winter; besides the 7,500 children, there were 
5,000 adult peasants taking courses in various 
aspects of modern farming (crop rotation, farm 
accounting, brigade organization, tractor driv-
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ing), 1,500 taking social and political courses 
preparatory to greater participation in govern-
ment, and 2,000 more in study circles for read-
ing and discussion without a teacher, since 
there were not enough teachers available. 

The stimulation, organizing and disciplin-
ing of all this energetic endeavour, centres in 
the Communist Party of the township. There 
were in all 317 Communists and 450 Young 
Communists in the population of 55,000, 
widely scattered through more than a hundred 
hamlets. Krotov, township secretary of the 
Party, was a living dynamo correlating all ac-
tivities. Though he had no government post 
and no one was legally held to obey his orders, 
yet he would be held ultimately responsible by 
the Party for the entire progress of Molvitino 
township. As servant of all and leader of all, he 
must organize motive power and direction for 
the complex machine of government institu-
tions and also for trade unions, cooperatives, 
study courses, peasant collective farms. 

The Communists of Molvitino 
During the sowing season Krotov’s work 

began at six in the morning, and ended at mid-
night. His office was clearing house for every 
problem. The training of unskilled tractor driv-
ers, the organization of twenty-seven summer 
courses in Marxism, the assignment of one 
hundred trade union members to their posts in 
“volunteer Sunday work” to help in sowing, 
the reports on seed shortage on increased flax 
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area in four villages — were questions I saw 
pass his desk in a single hour. Constantly 
working with Krotov were the four other most 
important men in the township: the chairman 
of the executive committee (i.e., head of local 
government), the head of the control commis-
sion (an inspecting, efficiency body surveying 
the work of Communists), the director of the 
tractor station (whose dozen tractors were the 
only mechanized industry in the township) and 
the head of political work for the tractor sta-
tion (who organized party work on the farms 
serviced by tractors). Lesser lights were the di-
rector of the township branch of the State 
Bank, the superintendent of schools, the chief 
of the land office, the secretary of the small 
trade union of office workers. 

Every one of these men had, besides their 
full-time job, an extra job of “party work” in 
helping the sowing. At two o’clock one morn-
ing I went with the township banker to his as-
signment at a small collective farm of twenty 
families. We trudged for three miles over ra-
vines and swamps and reached the still-sleep-
ing village as dawn was graying. The banker 
checked up their records, made suggestions on 
their bookkeeping, noted the joyful fact that 
“sowing will finish today noon,” discussed 
with them minor problems of organization, 
gave them the news of yesterday’s record in the 
township and was back at home by six a.m. He 
had two hours’ rest before his bank opened 
from nine to four, and was back again on 
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“party work” for the evening, checking up a 
different farm, of which he had several on his 
circuit. 

The 317 Communists and 450 Young Com-
munists all had similar farm assignments dur-
ing the sowing. Many of them were detached 
from their jobs for three weeks and sent to the 
farms as check-men, bookkeepers, repair men, 
supplementing the peasant labour by their cen-
tral connections and the knowledge of organi-
zation. Men like the banker, who could not be 
spared from their regular jobs, had morning 
and evening assignments. Even Communist 
mothers of small babies had assignments, to 
nearer farms. Their party task was to agitate, 
energize, organize the peasants of Molvitino to 
fight for good records in sowing; they carried 
news of the latest methods of farming, the lat-
est decrees on taxes. They were supplemented 
by a few hundred non-party teachers and trade 
union members who also volunteered under 
Krotov’s urging. They were also helped by sev-
eral hundred “peasant journalists” who posted 
up local “wall newspapers” and put through 
the sowing drive by energetic publicity on how 
everyone else was doing it. 

Krotov told me his method for winning the 
banner. “First,” he said, “was the sending of 
many of our best Communists out of the town-
ship posts into fieldwork, and the keeping up 
of the quality of party members in the farms; 
we see to it that every Communist is known by 
his works; if he isn’t, we clean him out quickly. 
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“That’s the real secret; the mass believes 
us, believes us without limit! Look what we did 
with the early sowing and the extra-early! 
Straight against century-old tradition we went. 
We said: plant three weeks earlier than before; 
plant on the mud of melting snow. And the 
masses, worried, wavering, believed us and 
planted. Already they see the shoots... The sec-
ond help was our organization plan, keeping 
day and night in touch with every collective 
farm during the period of sowing.” 

In scores of Soviet townships I have seen 
Krotov’s type of work repeated. The work of 
party secretary in a big industrial plant is sim-
ilar, organizing and stimulating the workers to 
production, self-education, participation in 
government activities, thus giving the motive 
power which helps the factory carry out its 
“plan.” And the “Plan” itself, where does that 
come from? Not from the party secretary and 
not alone from the plant’s own workers, and 
certainly not from Stalin, but from all of them 
together, endlessly interacting from centre out 
to the furthest periphery in a flexible network. 
The five or ten “responsible workers” of Mol-
vitino go often as delegates to the provincial 
capital, Ivanovo, where the Provincial Party 
Secretariat serves as clearing house for fifty-
five townships and fifty-five Krotovs. The less 
responsible people go less often. Yet any peas-
ant, toiling in distant fields, not even a party 
member, may, if he does some job with unu-
sual speed or skill, find himself sent to some 
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Congress of Farm Champions (udarniks) on a 
provincial scale or as far up as Moscow, to dis-
cuss new ways of improving the nation’s farms. 

“Power” and “Authority” 
And in Moscow decisions based upon all 

these concentrated reports are made and travel 
outward to be discussed and adapted to pro-
vincial conditions, and to be again discussed 
and adapted to localities. The ultimate destina-
tion towards which the Soviet ship of state is 
steering was fixed by the Revolution; the rate 
of speed and the daily or yearly course is 
charted by the Central Committee of the Com-
munist Party to take advantage of varying 
winds and tides. Yet it is a course which every 
active worker and peasant takes part in fixing. 
It arises from the experiences of three million 
Party members, each of them keeping in touch 
with some section of the masses, all of them 
interacting, discussing, comparing results. 
Communists of longest experience and best 
records have widest range and “authority”; but 
be it noted, they do not call it “power.” 
“Power” resides in decisions of the working 
masses; “authority” is that prestige of charac-
ter and knowledge which enables its possessor 
to make and interpret these decisions. 

It is “authority” rather than “power” that 
Stalin himself possesses. Though his standing 
is far higher than that of any other man in the 
Soviet Union, though he is cheered and quoted 
at all congresses, whether of governmental del-
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egates, trade unions or farms, yet no one in-
quires what is Stalin’s purpose or Stalin’s will. 
They inquire what is Stalin’s analysis of the sit-
uation, his summing up of problems and most 
important steps. I was struck at once by the 
contrast when I left the Soviet Union and vis-
ited Berlin and Washington. In Berlin I saw 
motion picture films bearing inscriptions: 
“Approved by Herr Von------, leader of our 
youth,” and was startled. No individual “ap-
proves” a film or book or drama in the USSR 
In Washington, I heard men say: “We do not 
yet know what the President will decide. No 
one is yet quite certain of his intentions.” Men 
do not speak thus in the USSR of Stalin. 

Let me give a brief example of how Stalin 
functions. I saw him preside at a small commit-
tee meeting, deciding a matter on which I had 
brought a complaint. He summoned to his of-
fice all the persons concerned in the matter, 
but when we arrived we found ourselves meet-
ing not only with Stalin, but also with Voroshi-
lov and Kaganovich. Stalin sat down, not at the 
head of the table, but informally placed where 
he could see the faces of all. He opened the talk 
with a plain, direct question, repeating the 
complaint in one sentence and asking the man 
complained against: “Why was it necessary to 
do this?” 

After this he said less than anyone. An oc-
casional phrase, a word without pressure; even 
his questions were less demands for answers 
than interjections guiding the speakers’ 
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thought. But how swiftly everything was re-
vealed, all our hopes, egotisms, conflicts, all 
the things we had been doing to each other. 
The essential nature of men I had known for 
years and of others I met for the first time came 
out sharply, more clearly than I had ever seen 
them, yet without prejudice. Each of them had 
to cooperate, to be taken account of in a prob-
lem; the job we must do and its direction be-
came clear. 

I was hardly conscious of the part played 
by Stalin in helping us reach a decision; I 
thought of him rather as someone superlatively 
easy to explain things to, who got one’s mean-
ing half through a sentence and brought it all 
out very quickly. When everything became 
clear and not a moment sooner or later, Stalin 
turned to the others: "Well?” A word from one, 
a phrase from another, together accomplished 
a sentence. Nods — it was unanimous. It 
seemed we had all decided, simultaneously, 
unanimously. 

Stalin’s Method 
That is Stalin’s method and greatness. He 

is supreme analyst of situations, personalities, 
tendencies. Through his analysis he is supreme 
combiner of many wills. A creator of collective 
will — such is supposed to be every Com-
munist, though by no means all of them meas-
ure to this high calling. The greatness of the 
man is known by the range over which he can 
do this. “I can analyse and plan with the work-
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ers of one plant for a period of several 
months,” said a responsible Communist to me. 
“Others, much wiser than I, like men on our 
Central Committee, can plan with wider 
masses for years. Stalin is in this our ablest. He 
sees the interrelation of our path with world 
events, and the order of each step, as a man 
sees the earth from the stratosphere. But the 
men of our Central Committee take his analy-
sis not because it is Stalin’s but because it is 
clear and convincing and documented with 
facts.” 

When Stalin reports to a congress of the 
party,1 or of the farm champions, or the heads 
of industry, none of his statements can be 
ranked as new. They are statements heard al-
ready on the lips of millions throughout the 
land. But he puts them together more com-
pletely than anyone else. He analyses them, 
shows the beginning, the end and all the stages 
to that end. He shows the farm champions the 
long, hard path to collective farming and just 
where they are on that path today. He shows 
the heads of industry what and why are the fun-
damental tasks in industry at the moment. He 
shows the party congress the chief tasks for the 
Soviet Union in the next few years. All of this 
he shows out of their own reports and 
knowledge, combining and relating these to 
the situation in the country and the world. It is 

 
1  Read his report to the 17th Congress of the Com-

munist Party, International Publishers, 1934. 
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not the statements or the policies that are new 
but the combining of them, so that they be-
come a collective program, unanimously and 
understandingly adopted. It is for this capacity 
that men cheer Stalin. 

Men never speak in the Soviet Union of 
“Stalin’s policy” but always of the “party line,” 
which Stalin “reports” in its present aspects, 
but does not “make.” The party line is accessi-
ble to all to study, to know and to help formu-
late within the limits set by the Revolution’s 
goal. There have indeed been statements by 
Stalin which have ushered in new epochs, as 
when he told a conference of Agrarian Marx-
ists that the time had come to “liquidate the 
kulaks as a class.” Yet he announced merely 
the time for a process which every Communist 
knew was eventually on the program. 

The famous article by Stalin entitled “Diz-
ziness from Success" which appeared in the 
Pravda, March 2, 1930, two months after the 
address to the Agrarian Marxists, and which 
called a sudden halt to the widespread excesses 
of Communist action in rural districts, was re-
garded by foreign correspondents and wide 
masses of peasants alike as an “order by Sta-
lin.” Stalin himself immediately disclaimed 
any personal prestige therefrom accruing, stat-
ing publicly in the press: “Some people believe 
that the article is the result of the personal ini-
tiative of Stalin. That is nonsense, of course. 
The Central Committee does not exist in order 
to permit the personal initiative of anybody in 
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matters of this kind. It was a reconnaissance 
undertaken by the Central Committee.” There 
is no need to assume, as many foreigners did, 
that this was a disingenuous disclaimer of per-
sonal rule. It was a very exact statement of fact. 

Stalin concluded his article on “Dizziness 
from Success”1 with the following words: “The 
art of leadership is a serious matter. One must 
not lag behind a movement, because to do so 
is to become isolated from the masses. But one 
must not rush ahead, for this is to lose contact 
with the masses... Our Party is strong and in-
vincible because, while leading the movement, 
it knows how to maintain and multiply its con-
tacts with the millions of the workers and peas-
ant masses.” This may be taken as Stalin’s 
analysis of “leadership.” 

Not by accident does Stalin guide from the 
post of “General Secretary of the Communist 
Party” rather than from any governmental of-
fice. For the work of the Communist Party is 
wider than and greater than that of govern-
ment; to run the state is but one of its many 
tasks. Part of its members, surrounded by 
much larger numbers of loyal “non-party” peo-
ple, are spared for the work of the state. Oth-
ers, similarly, aided by non-party sympathiz-
ers, run the great trade unions with their 18 
million members. Others guide the collective 
farms, which are economic organizations of 
peasants, in no sense governmental. Other 

 
1 See J.V. Stalin, Leninism, Vol. II, p. 280. 
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party members correlate the work of nation-
wide cooperatives, bringing them into har-
mony with the rest of the plan; organize the 
“Friends of Children,” the “Down with Illiter-
acy Society,” the “Auto and Good Roads 
Club” or the score of voluntary organizations 
which are non-governmental. 

A Party Mobilization 
As one last example of the interrelation of 

party, government and voluntary social forces, 
let me take the “mobilization” of automobiles 
and mechanics in the spring of 1931 to save 
flax-sowing in Moscow Province, in which 
even I, a woman, a foreigner, and not a party 
member, was called on to take part. Collective 
farming came that year to our province in a 
great drive of propaganda and organization 
backed by hundreds of new tractors, rented out 
to the collective farms through dozens of newly 
formed “tractor stations.” It was “plan” that 
year to increase flax area in our province, using 
the new tractors first for those farms that ex-
tended the sowing of flax. But in the first week 
of sowing, word came to Moscow that there 
was a “break.” Tractors all over the province 
stood in the fields, not moving, for complex 
causes yet to be analysed. 

Who moves in such a case? The Moscow 
Committee of the Communist Party acts. Sort-
ing over in its offices the reports of all Mos-
cow’s daily emergencies, it decides that the 
break in flax sowing is most serious of all. It 
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declares a “mobilization” of mechanics. 
Not a single mechanic in all Moscow is 

compelled to answer; that’s not what mobiliza-
tion means. Mobilization means that shop 
committees in a hundred centres announce and 
promote the idea; that mechanics willing to 
give some time in the sowing are helped by 
their foremen and fellow workers to arrange 
their jobs, and go forth on this sanctioned pub-
lic task without forfeiting wages, while others 
make up the gap at home. What is the motive? 
The fun of participating in saving the sowing, 
in running the country, the pleasure of living a 
vivid, useful, varied life. 

Automobiles are also “mobilized” to carry 
the mechanics to the farms. Since I have time, 
I decide to respond to the call. Our autos, five 
in number, loaded with sixteen mechanics, 
draw up in the afternoon at the Volokolamsk 
Tractor Station, one hundred and fifty miles 
north of Moscow, to which we are assigned. 
Quickly, in conference with the chief me-
chanic, we learn the condition of his tractors, 
in general and in detail. “That April lot from 
Putilov,” he swears. “Thirty-three we got, all 
new ones; rotten! Eleven of them can’t move 
on their own power from the railway station.” 

The “April lot” of Putilov tractors were 
made in a competition with Stalingrad. 
Pultilov won on quantity; the nearby tractor 
stations of Moscow Province received the 
product. Already the Putilov April tractors 
were damned as a crime. Not only were they 



 

33 

holding back sowing; they created what we call 
in the USSR a “political situation,” injuring 
the faith between city workers and peasants, 
injuring therefore the essence of government. 
Such was the difficulty we were called to help. 

Dividing the farms among our five automo-
biles we scattered, each to our own job. At 
early twilight I drove my load of three machin-
ists to a little farm of fifty families, working 
their soil in common with three tractors. Here 
we learned a second cause for the “break” in 
the sowing. The tractor drivers, six on two 
shifts, were peasant boys and girls who had 
seen their first machine one month before. 
When they heard a queer sound from the ma-
chine they stopped, afraid of breaking it, and 
waited for the mechanic. Hundreds of tractors 
all over Moscow Province waiting for mechan-
ics. And only a few dozen mechanics. This was 
the reason for our mobilization. 

All night, while I slept in the teacher’s 
room, the mechanic volunteers repaired trac-
tors. And all night the six local tractor drivers 
stood up to watch the job; such was their ea-
gerness to learn. When at four in the morning 
they called me to drive to the next farm, the lo-
cal boys and girls, drivers of tractors, kept right 
on work, driving out to the fields. 

Our second farm was a different sort, a 
backward lot. Neither bread nor tea they of-
fered our weary mechanics, arriving two hours 
past dawn. They swore at us instead; city work-
ers were we, those city workers who deceive 
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the farms with tractors. Take them, look at 
them, we don’t want them. 

Our city mechanics took them, looked at 
them, repaired them and put them to work in 
the fields. The attitude of the peasants grudg-
ingly changed. The younger ones came and 
thanked us. 

At four in the afternoon the five autos gath-
ered again at the tractor station to write a for-
mal statement which the Russians call an 
“Act.” It gave in technical terms the exact fault 
in every tractor and generalized from those 
faults. From the hard-won fields of Voloko-
lamsk, we put our fingers into the distant 
Putilov Plant in Leningrad and pointed out 
which shops were guilty. Certain iron castings 
regularly went to powder; a certain little gadget 
that a clever engineer had substituted for ball 
bearings wasn’t doing the work. It was clear, 
specific indictment, not of the Putilov tractor 
but of certain specified parts. All the mechan-
ics signed it. 

Through gathering dusk I drove my car to 
Moscow, five hours with sleeping mechanics in 
the seats. They had worked twenty hours on 
end and were entitled to rest. Next morning 
they would be back on their factory job, report-
ing to interested fellows on the Moscow flax 
sowing and the crimes of Putilov. The “Act” 
they had written went next day to the Indus-
trial Gazette, newspaper of heavy industry, 
chief monitor of Putilov. 

Printed on the authority of a dozen me-
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chanics, the indictment called the attention of 
the prosecuting attorney, who asked the auto-
mobile organization to keep on gathering data. 
It led to a summons sent to the chief of pro-
duction at Putilov, and a hearing held in the 
Commissariat of Heavy Industry attended by a 
dozen organizations interested in tractors. The 
affidavit made by our weary mechanics had 
been in truth an “Act,” with direct results in 
the tractor industry. And when spring passed 
into summer, the flax of Moscow Province, 
which in early season had threatened to lag at 
50 percent of plan, went over the top to 108 
percent, the best record in the Soviet Union. 
“It was the work of the social organizations 
that saved us,” said the Moscow Tractor cen-
tre. 

The Active Will of the Workers 
That’s how we did it. Where was the state 

in all this? The state owned the Putilov Works 
which made a fair tractor with certain serious 
but repairable flaws. The state financed the 
tractor stations which trained young drivers 
and sent out machines, some of which failed. 
The state-owned, through its Commissariat of 
Heavy Industry, the Industrial Gazette, which 
exposed the defects. But the driving will that 
saved the situation was the will of thousands of 
Moscow workers organized and assigned their 
tasks by the Moscow Committee of the Com-
munist Party, of which most of the mechanics 
were not even members. 
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We active worker-citizens were quite con-
sciously saving the sowing, repairing the 
threatened breach between city and farm, fix-
ing up gaps in the Putilov Tractor Works, get-
ting new tractor stations organized to work. 
We were handling essential details of govern-
ment. When it was done, we turned it over to 
the state. Since 1931 the flax of Moscow Prov-
ince is handled normally without “breaks” or 
“mobilizations.” But the active will of the 
worker-citizens, functioning through a score of 
organizations, has turned since then to a hun-
dred other emergencies. 

In my twelve years in the Soviet Union I 
have often been irritated and appalled by as-
pects of its daily struggle, its petty censorships 
and inefficiencies, the cost in human suffering 
of all essential progress. There are stupidities 
and violences in plenty, yes-men and career-
ists, hardship, injustice, wastage of youth and 
life. What makes them endurable is just this 
fact that they are caused not by behest of any 
one man or even of three million, but are part 
of the slow process (history will not call it 
slow) whereby the tens of millions across one-
sixth of earth’s surface create self-discipline, 
self-rule. Chief of the joys of life in the Soviet 
Union is to meet, in far-flung factories and 
farms, those ever-increasing men and women, 
able and tireless, who function after the man-
ner of Stalin, drawing out and combining the 
masses around them, creators of collective 
will. 
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Thus will they carry on, they feel quite con-
fident, initiating, organizing and forming new 
routine of habit, testing those habits and mak-
ing them over again till the practice of collec-
tive thought and action is so widespread that 
there is no need of a state. In these past twelve 
years I have seen the forms of the state 
changed often, administrative districts ex-
panded, contracted, new government depart-
ments added, combined or abolished, new 
functions given to the state or taken away and 
given to trade unions and cooperatives. The 
state today, in most of our common thought, is 
chiefly Foreign Office diplomacy, and the Red 
Army, both of which have the task of protect-
ing our peace to build. In internal affairs, the 
state makes workers’ rule secure against class 
enemies. It represents the concentration of our 
finance, the correlation of our industry, farm-
ing and transport, but even in these one hears 
less of the state than of the “line of the Party,” 
which plans beyond the state. Till socialist rev-
olutions in other lands and the cultural growth 
of humanity make not only the state but all po-
litical guidance no more needed, men of the 
forge and foundry, the farms and laboratories, 
cooperating through technical, social, and eco-
nomic relations, go forward with science to 
man’s domination of the world. 
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Publisher’s Note (NCASF) 
 
This pamphlet is intended as a popular, 

nontechnical statement of some of the leading 
features and achievements of Soviet agricul-
ture. Special emphasis is given to the im-
portant part played by Soviet farmers in win-
ning the war. American farmers, who have 
made such a great contribution individually 
and through their organizations to the defeat 
of the Axis, will be particularly interested in 
learning how the Soviet farmers have partici-
pated in bringing about Hitler’s downfall. 
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I. WHEN HITLER STRUCK 

When Hitler struck, the farms in the north 
of the USSR were ending their sowing and the 
farms of the south were beginning their har-
vest. By radio into every far-flung hamlet came 
the word that the greatest war in history was 
on. 

Would collective farming, successful in 
peacetime, prove able to meet the test of war? 
In other European lands the farm population 
had fled in panic and later, creeping back to its 
individual acres, had produced for the Nazis. 
But as the Germans poured into the Ukraine, 
a race began between them and the Soviet 
farmers for the grain harvest. Teachers, stu-
dents, city workers and the Red Army all 
helped get in the crops. By September 10, nine-
tenths of the Ukraine grain was harvested; by 
September to, before the Germans reached the 
rich heart of the Ukraine, some 60 percent of 
the grain had been removed from the areas 
near the front. 

Then crops began to “change addresses,” 
as the Russians said. Millions of farmers 
moved eastward taking their skills and their 
seeds. Before leaving they destroyed all that 
might benefit the enemy, delivered their live-
stock to the Red Army and got receipts. A 
thousand or two thousand miles to the east, 
their hosts met them. The hosts were other 
farming families, part of the great collective 
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farm system. The guests received shelter, food 
to live on till harvest, garden plots and jobs on 
the eastern farms, and sometimes a cow and 
chickens for family use. But none of this was 
charity. It was credit against their work share 
in the coming crop. 

Not all went eastward. Many remained be-
hind from choice or necessity. The able-bodied 
went into the woods as “partisan warriors,” at-
tacking the Nazis from the rear. Although 
known as guerrillas, they were unlike any guer-
rillas the world has known. They were 
equipped with rifles, machine-guns, mine-
throwers, flame-throwers, and divided into in-
fantry, cavalry, artillery, engineers. They com-
municated with the Red Army by two-way ra-
dio and by messenger plane. Some farmer units 
had their own aircraft. While their villages re-
mained under the German yoke they carried on 
consistent warfare against the enemy. When 
the Red Armies returned westward, they 
joined with them in the liberating of their vil-
lages, and the day after were back at their 
ploughs. 

The scientists and resourceful farmers of 
the Soviet collectives aided in another “change 
of addresses.” In the north, flax-growing was 
introduced, while cotton growers of the south 
sowed wheat to make up for losses in the occu-
pied regions. Sugar beets found a new home in 
the Caucasus, and sugar cane was introduced 
in Kazakhstan. 
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The Test of War 
To understand the test Soviet agriculture 

had to face, certain general facts about the war 
as it affected Russia should be borne in mind. 
For three years the Soviet people withstood 
more enemy soldiers than tsarist Russia, 
France, Britain and America combined during 
the first World War. Of the Kaiser’s 220 divi-
sions, 85 marched against Russia, plus Austro-
Hungarian divisions equivalent in firepower to 
about forty German divisions, and were 
enough to bring tsarist Russia to collapse and 
famine. Of Hitler’s 256 German divisions, 185 
marched against Russia with enough satellite 
troops to bring it up to between 240 and 257 
divisions. 

At the height of the Nazi penetration, an 
area of 600,000 square miles of Russia, includ-
ing the most productive farmlands producing 
about 40 percent of Russia’s farm output, was 
occupied. The area included two-fifths of the 
grain lands, half the potato fields, 85 percent 
of the sugar beet area, 60 percent of the area 
sown to sunflowers, Russia’s chief source of 
vegetable oil. The loss was equal to what the 
United States would suffer if all of Ohio, Indi-
ana, Illinois, Iowa, Missouri, Wisconsin and 
Southern Minnesota were in enemy hands. 

By Hitler’s seizure of the breadbasket and 
sugar-bowl of Russia, he hoped to feed his 
world-conquest, for which Western Europe is 
insufficient. For two years Hitler held the So-
viet breadbasket and sugar-bowl but he did not 
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get the bread and sugar — and the Soviet Un-
ion, though reduced to war rations — did not 
starve. 

The Life of a Front-Line Farm 
Let us see how the typical collective farm 

in the front-line regions met the test of war. 
Every farm had its working brigade of fifty to 
a hundred able-bodied men and women, long 
accustomed to team work. These could be-
come labour battalions for the army, bringing 
their own field kitchens, food and cooks. Every 
farm had its defence organization and its sport 
clubs, its sharp-shooters with weapons; here 
was the fighting group already formed. Every 
farm had its summer nursery managed by the 
older mothers with the aid of nurses; here was 
the group that evacuated the children to the 
rear. 

At first this typical Ukrainian collective 
farm was in the immediate rear of the Red 
Army. Through its long street rolled munition 
trucks for the front. In case of need, the ma-
chine shop was handy for repair work. Forty of 
the farmers worked full-time repairing roads 
for the army trucks. During a lull in the 
fighting, fifty Red Army men, in return, har-
vested forty acres of wheat and fifty acres of 
peas. Meantime gangs of farm girls and 
women, under direction of Red Army sappers, 
dug trenches and camouflaged them with foli-
age. 

Then the Red Army was forced to retreat. 
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The farm was informed. Young farmers en-
tered the granary, loaded the last nine trucks 
and sent them to the railway station camou-
flaged under green boughs. The trucks were 
turned over to the Red Army in return for re-
ceipts. Four tons of barley and vetch that could 
not be removed, were burned. The tractors 
ploughed down the sugar beets. The mechanics 
broke up the fuel tank; the blacksmiths de-
stroyed harvester and thresher, after burying 
the most expensive parts well-greased, to pre-
serve them. The best horses were hidden in the 
woods for the farmer guerrillas. Fourteen fat-
tened pigs were slaughtered for the Red Army, 
the rest delivered to the railway point. 

The Trek of a Machine and Tractor 

Station 
At the same time the Machine and Tractor 

Station that served the farms in this district 
took its equipment into the interior. Seventy 
tractors led the way, followed by truckloads of 
motors, harvesters, lathes. Behind them as 
they went they heard the thunder of artillery. 
Enemy planes attacked and killed several 
members of their column. They buried their 
dead and journeyed on. For days they crossed 
the Russian plains, then circled Stalingrad and 
headed south. A thousand miles to the south-
east near the Persian border they reached their 
destination. Jumping from their tractors, they 
picked up handfuls of soil, and declared it 
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good. 
Then the reception committee of local 

farmers who had come to meet them, handed 
them a large box of seed. “American seed,” 
they said. “Americans sent new seed for this 
new soil!” American seeds had also changed 
addresses in this global war! 

Fighting Farmers 
Two or three anecdotes will show how far 

the fighting Soviet farmers of today have 
changed from the once illiterate “muzhik.” A 
farmer discovered a German field telephone 
line, tapped it, and carried the connecting wire 
across the front to Red Army headquarters. 
Red Army men, listening to the German plans, 
were able to smash them. What old-style peas-
ant could have tapped a telephone line? 

By a sudden dawn attack a group of farmer 
fighters captured six German airplanes on the 
ground. They destroyed five. The sixth was 
flown to the Red Army by a farmer, who in 
civil life had taken flying courses as a hobby. 

A sixteen-year-old village boy discovered 
eight German tanks in a gully. The fighting 
farmers reconnoitring realized that the tanks 
were out of gas and awaiting supplies. They or-
ganized an attack by three groups: gasoline 
throwers, riflemen and tractor-drivers. The 
gasoline throwers sent the four end tanks up in 
flames. The twelve Germans who jumped out 
of the middle four tanks were shot by the rifle-
men. The four uninjured tanks were then 
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driven off to the woods by the tractor-drivers. 
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II. WAR AGAINST HUNGER 

While spectacular deeds like these were 
wearing down the Hitler troops on the 2,000-
mile front, the farmers of the unoccupied re-
gions carried on an equally important war. It 
was the war of the Russian people against hun-
ger. The Nazi occupation of the nation’s most 
fertile farming lands was a dangerous threat. 
No doubt the Germans counted on a Soviet 
collapse through hunger. 

The threat was met by the Russian farmers. 
“Plant new areas! Increase fertility!” were their 
slogans. They carried them out though the Red 
Army had taken the best of the manpower, 
many of the trucks and tractors and much of 
the liquid fuel. It was mainly women, children, 
old men and cripples who fought the war 
against famine. The farm women however, in-
cluded eleven million specialists! 

In the last war all branches of Russian ag-
riculture declined and the peasants were left 
destitute. But the collective farms have shown 
their vitality by increasing production under 
unimaginable obstacles. Take for example the 
Gorky region, an important Central Russian 
agricultural area. In the first years of the last 
war with its able-bodied men away, its horses 
and livestock decimated for the army’s use, its 
fields were turned to wasteland and cattle rais-
ing declined catastrophically. Its cultivated 
area slumped by over 500,000 acres. 
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In the present war, however, the cultivated 
area in this same region increased by almost 
400,000 acres in two years of war, and all yields 
were improved. During the war the number of 
cows in this region has increased by 67 percent 
and pigs by 118 percent. The tractors and 
horses turned over to the army were replaced 
by oxen. The men at the front were replaced by 
women and old people who achieved all this by 
putting in intensive work at long hours. Gorky 
region was no exception. Everywhere behind 
the lines the Soviet farms intensified in their 
work to make up for the loss of production in 
the occupied regions. 

In 1940, before the war, the Karpov family 
in the Urals had earned 654 “workdays” by 
joint labour, of which the man had earned 456, 
the wife 133 and the two boys in the early teens 
65. The father went to war, yet in 1942 the Kar-
pov family, accomplished 673 workdays, Mrs. 
Karpov raised her 133 to 387, and the two boys 
raised their 65 to 287. 

Russia’s collective farms were run by mil-
lions of Karpov families. In the desperate au-
tumn of 1941, they sowed to winter crops four 
million acres more than were sown in the same 
area the previous year. In 1942 the acreage in-
crease was 6,500,000 acres above the 4 million 
of 1941 and in 1943 there was a further in-
crease of 16,000,000 acres. 

In 1943, despite Nazi occupation, the total 
crop area of the Soviet Union was 26 percent 
larger than in 1913, and 39 percent larger than 
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in 1916, also the third year of a devastating 
war. And despite the loss to the farms of 
skilled manpower, each collective farmer culti-
vated twice the average area the Russian 
farmer cultivated in 1913. 

The Soviet People’s Rations 
It was a grim job, this war against hunger. 

The Red Army got its three squares a day and 
nobody grudged them. But most of Russia’s 
farmers went without sugar for two years. 
When American lard reached Russia, the 
housewives used it for a bread-spread; it was 
far too precious for cooking. Civilian Russia 
was on an iron diet of 1600 calories, as com-
pared with 2500 in wartime Britain and 3000 in 
wartime America. 

On that diet the Russian people worked 
twelve, thirteen, fourteen hours a day. It was 
worst of all in Leningrad. There during the 
siege people lived on five slices of black bread 
and two glasses of hot water a day. Yet on that 
food Leningrad worked, produced munitions, 
fought back the Germans. More people died of 
hunger in Leningrad than of German bombs. 
In the rest of Russia people died also, not ex-
actly of hunger, but of working too hard on too 
little food. Just as the Red Army was driven 
back by the German onslaught so the Russian 
people were driven back in the war with hun-
ger. And just as the Red Army kept its fighting 
organization unbroken until it was able to turn 
the tide toward victory, so the Russian people 
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held their ranks unbroken by hunger until that 
tide also turned. 

Women and Children Pitch in 
In the winter of 1941-42, 285,000 new trac-

tor drivers were trained and 49,000 combine 
operators. They were women whose men had 
gone to war. In the same winter the children in 
all the seventh, eighth, ninth and tenth grades, 
all over Russia, took special farming courses, 
preparing to help the farms. 

In February and March, the children’s 
field-groups, already organized, began corre-
sponding with the farms to which they were go-
ing. In March medical examinations were 
made, to tell what work each child might do 
without injury to health. Few children were 
needed in the ploughing season. They went in 
June, boys and girls separately, the schools 
closed two weeks early to let them go. That 
summer 3,505,348 children with 150,096 
teachers as leaders, did a total of 108,350,497 
grown-up “workdays” on the cooperative 
farms. 

Out on the farms the slogans were: “Save 
fuel... Get maximum acreage from every gallon 
of gas.” Seeds and fertilizer were transported 
by sleds in winter, sometimes by horsepower, 
often by womanpower, to save gasoline. Cows 
that were not good milkers were harnessed to 
harrows to save fuel. Thousands of tractors 
were refitted with gas generators using local 
fuels — wood, lignite and peat. A woman 
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named Darya won fame by working 2710 acres 
per tractor, while saving 1500 gallons of fuel; it 
was done by a steady driving pace of almost no 
stops, and constant care for the machines. A 
woman named Piatnitsa became a celebrity by 
reaping 4500 acres with her combine while sav-
ing 500 gallons of fuel. 

Ten million city workers planted victory 
gardens. Workers also went out as repair gangs 
to the farm area. One Siberian factory, which 
sent twenty repair gangs to its “adopted” farm 
region, wrote a letter saying: “It is not easy to 
spare these skilled workers from our factory, 
when so many have gone to the front, and our 
orders from the front for war supplies press 
night and day. But we pledge to make up for 
their absence by increased productivity and we 
expect you to make good with the food.” 

Through such efforts the battle against 
hunger was won. 

The Great Rebuilding 
At last the tide turned on the long front of 

battle. Near Moscow in the winter of 1941-42 
the farmers began to go back to the lands the 
Nazis had destroyed. They found a total dev-
astation such as men have not seen in all his-
tory. All buildings burnt; all livestock slaugh-
tered; all able-bodied people taken away into 
slavery, apart from those who had died or been 
killed. The few survivors were exhausted and 
ill. Even the partisans wore homemade straw 
sandals, for their shoes were long worn out. 
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The Russian farmers who had made the 
great retreat eastward, now streamed back. 
The government railways provided free trans-
portation. The government textile trusts pro-
vided some clothing. The Machine and Tractor 
Stations moved back with them. The spare 
parts that had been discreetly buried through 
the period of German rule were now dug up. 
As the Red Army advanced westward, 
trainloads of farm machinery advanced behind 
the Army, gifts from the eastern farms. The 
Rostov region alone received from the eastern 
regions 4000 tractors, of which 1400 were cat-
erpillars, 400 combines and other machines in 
proportion. 

Without a roof over their heads, the arriv-
ing farmers dug themselves into the frozen 
earth of winter and prepared for spring. And in 
all of the great untouched eastern country, 
every region that had a good harvest 
“adopted” one of the devastated districts and 
began a competition as to which should be first 
rebuilt. 

On March 3, 1943, the Commissariat of 
Agriculture announced that it was already 
clear that in the regions liberated during the 
winter the cultivated area would be as large as 
before the war. In a district on the Don where 
the Germans had carried off or destroyed 6,000 
horses, 7,000 cows and 50,000 sheep, the har-
vest after reoccupation was as large as in times 
of peace. In the North Caucasus, the Ivano ir-
rigation system which waters 25,000 acres of 
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rice lands, blown up by the retreating Germans 
in the winter of 1942-43, was restored for the 
spring sowing in 1943. 

On March 3, 1943, the Commissariat of 
Agriculture announced the possession of the 
liberated regions by ordering the return of 
farm animals, sending back to the farmers 
197,166 head of cattle, 50,939 horses and 
341,421 sheep. 

It will take long to rebuild the homes of 
these ruined areas. It will take longer to grow 
the orchards that the Nazis cut down. But if the 
devastation was the greatest in all history, the 
rebuilding will be the swiftest ever known. 

Already those farmers in their sod dugouts 
are saying: “This time we shall build it all new! 
The Nazis made a clean sweep of everything. 
So now we shall build farms and cities from the 
earth up, all of the most modern kind.” 

They know that they can do it. For they 
have the organization, and the will and the 
knowledge. And they own the resources of 
one-sixth of the land surface of the earth. 
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III. THESE ARE THE FARMERS 

OF RUSSIA 

Stephen Baryshub is a farmer of Russia. He 
was born in 1861, the year that serfdom was 
abolished. (In America we were setting the 
slaves free.) In his youth he saw peasants 
flogged by the landlord’s agents. He lived 
through three reigns and two Revolutions and 
was nearly 60 when the Soviets came to 
power... At the age of 77 he stood as chairman 
on the platform in the Kremlin to open the Su-
preme Soviet of the Russian Republic. 

Besides being an elected member of gov-
ernment, Baryshub runs an experimental farm 
on the Upper Volga. During the war 115 kinds 
of melons ripened in the old man’s garden and 
24 kinds of grapevines flourished on his ter-
races above the river. But in his 82nd year he 
had a new task: to move flax-growing north. 

“The invaders have ruined our oldest flax 
districts and we must develop new bases. I 
have a new hard flax that resists frosts,” he 
said. And flax moved into Siberia and the Far 
East. 

Farmer Scientists and Engineers 
In the same year of war a Russian scientific 

farmer evolved a new variety of rust-immune 
spring wheat and achieved the creation of per-
ennial rye. In the same year Professor Dunin 
devised a graft method of planting potatoes 



 

56 

that saved 36,000,000 pounds of seeds. In the 
same year plant specialist Lysenko organized 
half a million youngsters to gather potato eyes 
and plant them on 300,000 acres, saving 
150,000 tons of potatoes for food. The scientist 
Bushinsky experimented with deep sub-soil 
ploughing against the day when war ravaged 
soil could be restored to fertility. 

In the same year of war a Russian farmer 
behind the German lines wrote a letter: “Let us 
carry food over the front to hungry Lenin-
grad.” The letter went from village to village 
until it had three thousand signatures. Then 
the farmers met in their villages, on an island 
of land completely surrounded by Germans, 
and elected their best people Lo drive the 
carts. They took two hundred carls of food 
across the German lines to the besieged city. 
Thirty of the drivers were women. Three weeks 
later the 200 carts made a second trip. 

In the same year of war the cotton growers 
of Central Asia eased the strain on the central 
grain supply by ploughing two million virgin 
acres for wheat without interfering with their 
cotton. Sixty thousand farmers on the borders 
of Iran built a 35 mile irrigation canal over a 
divide to water 90,000 acres of rich soil. Farm-
ers of Kirghizia, who ten years ago were illit-
erate nomads like early American Indians, 
built twenty electric power stations during two 
years of war. 

These are the farmers of Russia. They carry 
on the agriculture of one-sixth of the earth’s 
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land surface. They are some twenty million 
farming families, united in 250,000 large-scale 
farms, cooperatively owned and managed. 
They consider their system of collective power-
farming the most advanced in the world. To-
gether with the excellent Red Army, and the 
workers of the state-owned enterprises, they 
form the three great pillars of strength of mod-
ern fighting Russia. 

“Cornerstone of Soviet Strategy” 
Ambassador Davies thus describes the col-

lective farms of Siberia, as he saw them from 
the air. “I shall never forget the impression. 
Flying at a height of 1000 to 1500 feet I saw a 
tremendous farming region... great fields big-
ger than our townships, in different colours of 
grain all planted with precision, orderly and 
well kept... This hinterland of wealth — is the 
cornerstone of Soviet strategy.” 

Collective farming — since the early 1930’s 
the dominant type of farming in Russia — 
made possible the new type of “People’s War.” 
It gave the Russian farmers a mighty incentive 
for fighting and a highly efficient weapon with 
which to fight. Through the collective farms 
they were able to evacuate their harvest and 
much of their farm equipment in record time. 
Through the collective farms they set up those 
heroic bands of fighting farmers who attacked 
the Germans from the rear. Through their col-
lective farms they fed the Russian people, even 
when a large section of their grain area was in 
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enemy hands. Through their collective farms 
they were able to do what no other nation ac-
complished — to turn homeless refugees into 
immediate producers of wealth. 

Stalin bore testimony to their devotion and 
effectiveness. In his address on November 7, 
1943, he praised the “high degree of under-
standing of the common national interest” 
which the Soviet farmers showed. He added 
that, even when the country was deprived of 
the Ukraine, the Don and the Kuban valleys, 
the collective farms were able to supply the 
army and the country with food “without seri-
ous interruption.” “Without the collective 
farming system, without the selfless labour of 
the men and women collective farmers, we 
could not have coped with this most difficult 
task.” 

From the Dark Past 
What makes these achievements seem so 

miraculous is the dark past that constitutes 
their historical background. 

In pre-revolutionary Russia nearly half the 
land belonged to the royal family, the monas-
teries and large landholders. The rest was scat-
tered among some twenty million peasant fam-
ilies, few of whom lived on their own soil. They 
lived in villages where they had lived since the 
Middle Ages, when they were serfs on the big 
estates. They commonly had “land rights,” ra-
ther than permanent title to particular pieces. 
Periodically the village lands would be redi-
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vided, ostensibly giving each family its share of 
the good land, the bad land, the distant land 
and all other kinds of land. A moderately well-
off peasant would have fifteen to twenty acres, 
but it would be divided in three to thirty pieces, 
some of them miles away from his village hut. 
He would spend as much time walking to his 
pieces as in actual labour on the soil. 

The strips were long and narrow. It was 
hard to turn a harrow on them. They were sep-
arated by hard boundary ridges, a breeding 
place for weeds. The only good thing to be said 
for this kind of land division was that, when it 
was finally abolished by cooperative farming, 
it was easy to throw the narrow strips together 
and plough them with tractors from horizon to 
horizon. There were no fences or other struc-
tures to interfere. 

The old peasant tools were crude, mostly 
wooden and commonly made at home. The 
commonest plough was a heavy wooden stick 
known as “sokha”; better-off peasants bought 
an iron blade and set it in this wooden plough. 
“I never saw a riding-plough in Russia,” said 
George G. MacDowell, an American farmer 
who lived for fifteen years in Russia, helping to 
modernize the farms. “I have seen hundreds of 
primitive wooden sticks such as were used in 
Egypt when the pyramids were built. The Rus-
sians jumped from these to the tractors without 
going through the intervening stages.” 

Sowing was by hand-scattering, reaping by 
sickle or scythe, and threshing by stone rollers 
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dragged by oxen over a dirt floor. Such meth-
ods left the Russian peasants poverty-stricken. 
One-third of them had only a single horse 
while another third had no horse at all, renting 
an animal from wealthier neighbours and pay-
ing for it with as much as half the crop. Such 
poor peasants could not live off their land, so 
they also worked as farmhands for the wealth-
ier neighbours who were known as “kulaks” — 
(fists) — because they combined farming with 
moneylending and property-lending. 

There is no exact American equivalent for 
the “kulak,” since America’s more developed 
capitalism has specialized the functions of 
banking. Our banker-owned farms are perhaps 
the nearest equivalent. “Kulaks” represented 
the beginnings of capitalism in the feudal vil-
lage. Kulaks farmed, but they made their larg-
est income by lending property, by buying 
crops for resale to the cities, etc. 

Illiteracy was general among the peasants; 
only one out of ten could read and write at the 
time of the Russian Revolution in 1917. They 
were sunk in superstition. They farmed accord-
ing to the dates of the church festivals, relying 
on religious processions as the accepted way to 
get rain. With the gradual retarding of the Rus-
sian church calendar, the “religious” days for 
sowing were about a fortnight late. But no 
peasant dared break soil before the field-bless-
ing, lest he incur bad luck. In case of drought 
or any emergency, the peasants marched with 
holy pictures while the priest sprinkled holy 
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water, as they went singing and praying 
through the fields. The customs of the middle 
ages held in the countryside. George B. Mac-
Dowell describes a procession with ikons and 
torches in the North Caucasus, against a grass-
hopper pest. The cause of modern farming was 
greatly advanced when the younger farmers, 
with Paris green, kerosene, gas and airplanes, 
wiped out in three weeks the grasshoppers 
which such processions had not been able to 
do away with in three hundred years. 

The First Cooperative Farms 
Any outsider who looked at the Russian 

countryside in November 1927, ten years after 
the Russian Revolution, would have said that 
modern power-farming lay a century or more 
in the future. Actually, it was just around the 
corner. Anybody could know it who troubled 
to read what Stalin and other Russian leaders 
were saying. 

How could those narrow strips on which it 
was hard to turn a tractor, be modernized for 
power-farming? How could those weed-in-
fested boundary ridges be ploughed under, cre-
ating large farm areas for machines? The quick 
way, the just way and the prosperous way, the 
Russian leaders had decided, was to induce 
those twenty million peasants to combine their 
lands into large producers’ cooperative farms. 
But a farm population takes convincing; and 
this needs education and time. 

Immediately after the Revolution the new 
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government had encouraged cooperative activ-
ity of every kind. Existing cooperative stores 
were given first chance at the output of state-
owned factories and rapidly grew into the dom-
inant form of rural trade. Cooperative pro-
cessing plants, such as creameries, cheese fac-
tories, oil presses, starch factories, were helped 
by government credits, and became an im-
portant factor in the food industry of the na-
tion. By 1926 the Russian consumer coopera-
tives with over ten million members had be-
come the strongest cooperative movement in 
the world. 

Cooperation in actual farm production is 
much more complicated and went at first more 
slowly. The government encouraged this also 
with easy credits and priorities on farm ma-
chinery. This attracted the poorer peasants 
who saw in the cooperatives a change to escape 
financial bondage to the usurious kulaks. 
Some modern farm practice seeped into the vil-
lage through these early cooperatives. But 
since most of their first members were from the 
poorest peasantry, it took some years for them 
to overtake the standard of living of the mod-
erately well-off peasant. 

These early farming cooperatives were of 
several kinds, ranging from groups that com-
bined temporarily to purchase a few machines 
to closely organized “communes” which held 
their lands, machines, livestock and even some 
living facilities in common, such as dining-
rooms and nurseries. The form that most at-
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tracted the peasant families, however, lay mid-
way between these extremes. It was called the 
artel or kolkhoz (collective farm). Its members 
kept their houses, garden plots and family live-
stock separately but pooled the fields that lay 
outside the village, and the draft animals and 
implements needed to work them. Members 
were assigned tasks under an elected manage-
ment and drew harvest-shares in proportion to 
their work. 

By November 1, 1927, ten years after the 
Revolution, the farm families in various types 
of producers’ cooperatives numbered 195,000, 
which would have been regarded as an achieve-
ment by the cooperative movements of most 
countries; but this was less than one farming 
family in every hundred on the vast lands of the 
USSR. Outwardly they made little difference 
to the picture of the Russian countryside; most 
of the land was still farmed with primitive tools 
in long thin strips. The cooperatives them-
selves were small groups, from ten to thirty 
families working an average of 150 crop acres. 
Often their lands were still scattered in many 
pieces among the village fields. This was far 
from what Soviet leaders regarded as the ur-
gent need of the country — a basic change-over 
to mechanized farming through cooperative 
forms. 

Modern mechanized farming seemed out-
wardly very distant. But the Russian govern-
ment leaders, who kept close to the inner 
changes in the country, knew that hard-headed 
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peasants everywhere were impressed with the 
success of the farm cooperatives, through 
which the village poor were attaining a stand-
ard of living equal to the best; that a usable 
form of the cooperative organization was al-
ready established, the “artel,” or as it came to 
be known in its more developed form, the “kol-
khoz,” or collective farm. Since the nation’s in-
dustries were at last ready to turn out tremen-
dous numbers of new farm implements and 
would soon begin to produce tractors and com-
plex machines they felt that the time had come 
at last for a nationwide drive for modem farm-
ing. 
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IV. THE GREAT DRIVE FOR 

MODERN POWER FARMING 

The drive for modern farming began at the 
end of 1927. Farm credits and supplies of ma-
chinery to collective farms were rapidly in-
creased. A new tax law gave collectives special 
exemptions. A new land law provided that in 
any village land redivision, the collectives got 
first choice and might take their land all in one 
piece. 

In the next six months the membership of 
the collective farms doubled. Four months 
later it had doubled again. By October 1, 1929 
— less than two years later — there were 
1,919,000 families in collective farms, an al-
most tenfold growth. Then came the great 
“Collectivization Week” in October 1929, 
when thousands of organizers poured into the 
villages, backed by machinery and credits. 
Peasants swarmed into the collectives so fast 
they couldn’t be listed. 

By May 1930, nearly six million peasant 
families — a quarter of the farm population — 
had joined collective farms. The pace was so 
much faster than the government expected that 
it took five years to supply all the promised 
machines. 

The new farms not only demanded more 
machinery than the country was producing, 
they needed more mechanics, bookkeepers 
and trained people than Russia had ever had. 
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Working out farm practices for large scale 
farming for which the world had no precedent 
with peasants accustomed to strip farming, cre-
ated terrific organization problems involving 
tractors, horses, oxen, and hundreds of men 
and women unaccustomed to joint work. Many 
farms failed, though the government helped 
them with repeated credits and later cancelled 
the debts. Discouraged members deserted 
farming for what seemed easier city jobs. For 
three years the new farms barely fed the coun-
try and the town populations went on iron ra-
tions of scanty bread. 

On the other hand, millions of city workers 
in thousands of local campaigns poured into 
the country districts to help out the farmers in 
special emergencies. They knew that Russia’s 
medieval agriculture held back the nation; that 
only with modern farms could Russia be pros-
perous and secure. I personally drove four me-
chanics for a weekend of volunteer help when 
the flax-sowing of the Moscow district was 
threatened. My auto was part of a general cam-
paign involving hundreds of autos and thou-
sands of mechanics. The four men that I took 
worked 36 hours on end repairing tractors, 
while their fellow-workers made good their ab-
sence from the factory by doing double shifts. 
Not content with tractor repair, the mechanics 
listed the faults they found in the new Soviet-
made tractor and published them. Two weeks 
later I attended an investigation in which the 
chief of production of the Putilov Tractor 
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Works was called before the attorney general 
of Russia, informed that he had committed a 
serious crime by injuring the faith of the Soviet 
peasants in Soviet industry, and that not an-
other tractor could leave his works until the 
quality was improved. Incidentally, our drive 
saved the flax-sowing of Moscow province that 
year — a gift of Moscow’s city workers to the 
farms. 

The Red Army also turned out to help. I 
have seen its trained manpower go down a field 
like clockwork, starting and stopping to bu-
gles, while the peasants strove to copy its pre-
cision. Every farm lad who returned from two 
years military service came back a qualified ex-
pert in some branch of modern farming, 
thereby winning for the Red Army the nick-
name “The Peasants’ University.” 

Short winter courses were opened in every 
city for the surrounding farmers. In the city of 
Omsk in Siberia in the single winter of 1929-30 
I saw 20,000 farm men and women taking three 
months’ courses in every specialty from 
bookkeeping to tractor driving, handling cows 
or chickens or managing a 50,000-acre farm. 
The Russian farm population got the habit of 
universal study for adults, which they never af-
terwards dropped. 

Kulak Opposition 
Another difficulty was the fierce opposi-

tion put up by the kulaks. Their financial dom-
inance of rural life was being broken by the co-
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operatives and they fought them by means 
ranging from rumourmongering to arson and 
murder. They poured kerosene on tractors and 
burned them; they set fire to collective farm 
barns when all the animals were in the stalls, 
and started deadly epidemics among the cattle. 
They mutilated or murdered farm organizers 
and government agents. Some of the more re-
actionary priests took a hand, denouncing the 
collective farms as “godless” because they no 
longer farmed by saints’ days, or as “immoral 
breakers of homes,” because in them old and 
young were equal, upsetting the patriarchal 
family rule of the Old Man. In the collective 
farm the young men, fresh from farm schools, 
had a vote as good as their fathers,’ while hard-
working wives collected more income than 
husbands who drank or idled. To the backward 
this seemed the breakdown of all morality; but 
the great majority hailed it as the road to free-
dom and to life. 

Kulak sabotage reached such a pitch that 
there was practically a state of war in many vil-
lages. Laws were passed permitting the depor-
tation of kulaks on petition from any village 
that had adopted “wholesale collectivization,” 
i.e. where nearly everyone had joined the col-
lective farm. Such villages held general meet-
ings of all inhabitants, and called before them 
the local kulaks for questioning and judge-
ment. Most kulaks were merely warned but a 
total of several hundred thousand were listed 
for deportation. County authorities checked 
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the list to guard against grudge-listing. Depor-
tees were either sent with their families and 
some livestock to pioneer farming regions or 
to construction jobs in the Urals and Siberia 
where they worked at regular wages. After 
three years they were allowed to work where 
they chose, for by that time the organization of 
the collective farms had become secure. Rus-
sians believe that without these deportations, 
the early collectives might have collapsed un-
der their difficulties, leading to general famine 
and exposing a weakened nation to invasion 
from abroad. It was brought out in the Mos-
cow trials that the enemies of the USSR were 
utilizing the kulaks to bring about just this. 

1932 — The Critical Year 
The worst emergency came in 1932, a year 

of drought. This, added to other difficulties of 
the new farming’s first stages, caused a serious 
grain shortage. In many Ukrainian fields the 
discouraged farmers simply failed to gather 
their harvest. In many cases, disgruntled ku-
laks sought to further worsen conditions by re-
fusing to gather more than they needed for 
themselves. The government awoke to the real 
situation when the unreaped grain was under 
the snow. Then it took drastic measures. The 
farms everywhere owed the government grain 
in payment for the use of the tractors and other 
machinery, for which they paid rental in kind. 
For two years, the government had been leni-
ent in collecting, knowing the difficulties of the 
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farms. In 1932 they enforced collection to se-
cure the grain needed to ration the entire coun-
try, including the defaulting farms, and (a fact 
not realized at the time) to build up reserves 
against the threat of invasion by Japan, which 
had entered Manchuria and was probing the 
Soviet frontier. 

The year 1932-33 was described abroad as 
a man-made famine in which Stalin starved 
peasants for refusing to join collective farms, 
ignoring the fact that the peasants had already 
joined the collectives, and that drought had 
piled upon other difficulties to produce short-
ages. The government took from the farmers 
only what they owed on their contracts and 
used what was collected to save the whole 
country, including the farmers. Statistics show 
no decline in population during the collectivi-
zation period, 1930-34, and no tremendous rise 
in deaths from hunger or any other cause. The 
fall in the rate of population increase was com-
parable to that in the United States which was 
passing through its own difficulties in the same 
period. Facts about the grain shortage were 
concealed for a year by Soviet censorship lest 
knowledge of Soviet internal difficulties 
should provoke an attack by Japan. 

In the summer following the critical year of 
1932, the help of the Red Army and the city 
workers to the farms reached its maximum in 
what was considered a national emergency. All 
these methods brought the country to the good 
harvest of 1933. By that time, better farm prac-
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tice and increased machinery won final victory. 
There has never been a harvest failure since. 



 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
A collective farm woman with a guerrilla band 

deep in the woods behind the German lines, helps 
to provide nourishment for the wounded. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Bringing in the harvest with combines on a 

North Caucasus collective farm. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
A group of collective farmers visiting the great 

Agricultural Exhibit in Moscow. 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 

Agricultural machinery park of a typical 
Machine and Tractor Station (MTS) in the 
Ukraine. 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Studying wheat germination in the “cottage 

laboratory” of a collective farm in the Chuvash 
Autonomous Republic. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Their lands and homes devastated by the 

Germans, millions of collective farmers had to take 
refuge in dugouts such as this. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
A Turkmenian schoolgirl helps bring in the 

barley harvest of a collective farm in her native 
republic. 
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V. SECURITY ON THE SOIL 

The years 1930-33 will go down in man-
kind’s story as a turning point in the [arm his-
tory of the world. In those four earth-shaking 
years the Soviet Union changed over from a 
country of badly tilled farm strips and frequent 
famines to collective farms without crop fail-
ures — the largest farm units in the world. By 
this change the Russian farmers won the dream 
of centuries — security on the soil. 

Security on the soil. From drought, from 
floods, from mortgages, from market uncer-
tainties, from the chances of nature and the ex-
ploitations of man. Even to attain fragments of 
such security, men in all ages have struggled, 
emigrated, pioneered — and only a few won the 
fragments! 

What is the basis of the Russian farmers’ 
security? 

First of all, they cannot lose their land by 
foreclosure. The lands of the collective farms 
are not subject to sale, lease or mortgage; they 
are legally public domain, granted by the gov-
ernment to the collective farmers “without 
payment and without time limit, that is, for-
ever” as the Soviet Constitution words it. 
Farms may be enlarged by the entrance of new 
members or the reclamation of new land. As 
long as the farmers use their land, it cannot be 
diminished. When whole villages have to be 
moved, as for the building of the Moscow-
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Volga Canal, or to prevent contamination of 
the Moscow water system, it is done by agree-
ment with the farmers, who receive an equal or 
greater amount of land in return. 

The Soviet farmers thus pay nothing for 
land. Neither do they go into debt for heavy 
machinery, which they secure on a rental basis, 
paid in kind, from a unique institution, known 
as the Machine and Tractor Station. This is a 
government-owned enterprise which services a 
whole district with machine-power, working 
the machines far more continuously than is 
done on American farms. In this way overhead 
costs are cut on machinery. The collective 
farmers invest the greater part of their surplus, 
not in depreciating machinery but in livestock, 
orchards or other diversifications of farming, 
which produce increasing return. 

Security against Market Fluctuations 
Security against collapse of markets is at-

tained by advance sales. Each farm has a mini-
mum quota which it is expected to sell to the 
government at fixed price; from this the gov-
ernment feeds the army and some of the heavy 
industry. The rest of the crop is also contracted 
in various ways, to municipalities, factory din-
ing-rooms or universities, usually at a some-
what higher price. If the crop runs higher than 
expected, the government stands ready to ab-
sorb as much as the farmers wish to sell at the 
fixed price, which protects the farmers against 
loss. The farmers have the option of disposing 
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of their surplus to private consumers through 
collective farm markets in the cities. There are 
no middlemen and speculation in food is a se-
rious crime. If the government has to absorb 
an over-abundance of any crop, the next year’s 
contracts are adjusted to encourage different 
crops. No farmer has to guess what crops will 
be profitable; each crop is made profitable by 
advance plan. Prices are so adjusted that the 
crops which the country most needs and which 
the region is best adapted to produce, are the 
most profitable. 

Losses through “Acts of God” 
No Soviet farmer ever faces the ethical 

problem posed to me by an American farmer 
some years ago. He told me that floods had de-
stroyed the crops of neighbouring districts so 
that the profits from his own crop rose. “So we 
must be pleased when our brother farmers go 
bankrupt, because our profits increase. And 
we must be sad when there is food enough for 
the hungry because our profits drop!” There is 
no such conflict between individual good and 
community good in the Soviet Union. The big-
ger the harvest, the more food and the more 
profits for everybody. It is to everybody’s ad-
vantage everywhere to produce a maximum 
crop. 

Crop losses through “acts of God” are min-
imized by better farm practice and are covered 
by universal farm insurance. The amount of in-
surance varies. It is compulsory to insure at 
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least for a minimum harvest. This costs only 
one percent and provides that even in the worst 
drought, Hood or hail the farmer will get a re-
turn on which he can carry on. The more pro-
gressive farms are not content with this mini-
mum insurance, but may insure for higher 
amounts up to a bumper crop at a cost of two 
or three percent. 

Thus the collective farms are secure against 
everything except inner disorganization 
through laziness or incompetence. Safeguards 
are provided even against this, by the system 
of achievement payments, which encourage 
energy and initiative. This question of incen-
tive and rewards for work takes us into the 
whole question of the relation of the individual 
farming family to the larger collective farm. 

What the Farming Family Gets 
Security is all very well, but what about 

freedom? How much individual choice has the 
farming family? What chance to develop spe-
cial talents? What chance to advance through 
pre-eminence in work? What, after all, does the 
farmer family get from participation in the col-
lective farm? 

First of all, the collective farm is democrat-
ically governed. Every farm worker over the 
age of sixteen has equal voice and vote in the 
general meeting, which elects the management 
and decides all basic questions, such as the 
farm plan, the crop rotation and the division of 
work. Members specialize according to choice 



 

81 

and aptitude. All jobs are listed in a scale of 
values according to their difficulty and the skill 
required. The basic unit of pay is known as the 
“workday,” which is a piece-work unit based 
on eight hours average work of a semi-skilled 
man. Eight hours by a skilled worker such as a 
tractor-driver may count as two workdays, 
while higher skills may be paid for at several 
days’ quota in a single day. Jobs are checked 
by quantity and quality, and each day’s accom-
plishment is entered in the member’s work-
book. His harvest income depends on his ac-
tual work. 

Collective farmers are not wageworkers, 
though their income is determined much like 
wages.1 They are joint owners of the collective 
farm property. Their “workday” is valued not 
in money but in harvest shares. Each member 
draws advances during the year to feed his fam-
ily. His full income is known only when all the 
harvest is in. Then, after taxes and machine 
rentals are paid, seed and fodder reserves set 
aside, and appropriations made for permanent 
improvements, for insurance, for cultural 
needs (the total, however, not exceeding 40 
percent of the cash income), the remainder is 
divided among the members, in proportion to 

 
1 Employees of the Machine and Tractor Sections are 

wageworkers, as are those of the state farms, or sovkhoz. 

The latter play an important role in large-scale farming, in 
experimental farming, and as training centres. But since 
they do not represent the way of life of the vast majority of 
Soviet farmers, they will not be dealt with in this pamphlet. 
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the “workdays,” they have earned. This gives 
incentive to earn many “workdays,” and an 
equally strong incentive to increase the farms’ 
general prosperity which determines the value 
of each “workday.” 

Machinery without Grief 
Machines, on the Soviet farms, as every-

where else, rapidly released labour. In other 
lands this would have created millions of un-
employed. Collective farmers, owning the 
lands of their village, easily found use for all 
possible labour power. The first result was im-
provement and diversification of farming. To 
the routine of rye and wheat were added prof-
itable industrial crops, orchards, new vegeta-
bles. Model dairy farms and chicken-ranches 
were developed, which not only increased the 
profit of the collective farm but supplied pure 
bred stock for the households of members. 
Collective farms began to build power-plants 
to light their villages, irrigation systems, air-
fields for the educational airplanes of the Com-
missariat of Agriculture, laboratories for farm 
experiment. In some places movements started 
for “model farm-cities,” villages with all the 
improvements of the big towns. The labour re-
leased by machines, instead of spilling into a 
reservoir of unemployed, was organized to 
raise the standard of living of the countryside. 

Each family, besides its share in the collec-
tive farm fields, has its private garden and or-
chard patch, varying from half an acre to three 
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acres, and its family livestock, such as cow, 
sheep, and chickens, whose products they 
could use for themselves or sell as they saw fit. 
As collectives gained experience and stability, 
this individual husbandry often diminished in 
importance, by the farmers own choice. Many 
farmers said that, after a day’s work in the 
fields, they preferred to dress up and go to the 
movies “like city folk.” Other farmers chose to 
make additional income or to work out some 
hobby in these private gardens. In today’s war 
emergency, both the collective fields and the 
private gardens are farmed at high pressure. 
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VI. A NEW FARM FOLK 

The new farm life has produced what Stalin 
described as “an entirely new peasantry such 
as the world has not seen.” As the farm as a 
whole goes in for diversification, each job in it 
becomes a specialty. The farmer-specialists 
compete for excellence: they break national 
and even world records. Their achievements 
become front page news in the Soviet press and 
are rewarded with government decorations and 
large prizes, for these achievements are not pri-
vate matters but increase the total wealth of the 
nation. 

The Record Breakers 
In 1935 a tractor-driver named Bupartsev 

began driving in high gear for harrowing, then 
for sowing and finally for harvesting. His 
methods, which demanded exceptional atten-
tion to the ground, were copied by thousands 
within a year. A girl swineherd made a 
“pledge” to the country to raise 3600 pounds 
of offspring per sow in the year. She rigged up 
special pens in the pastures so that the animals 
would not lose weight by needless travel; she 
supervised their food, drink and regime with 
meticulous care. She too became a national 
heroine. 

(Americans who have been privileged to 
see the delightful Soviet musical film, “They 
Met in Moscow,” have seen her counterpart in 
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the heroine of this picture.) 
A harvester-combine normally harvests 40 

to 50 acres per day; Russian champions in 1936 
got 125 to 150 acres by adding night work. 
Then three women operators of harvester-
combines broke world records by harvesting a 
total of 248, 252, and 274 acres respectively in 
a single twenty-four hours. The chief inspector 
of the Rostov Farm Machinery Works went to 
their farm to check the record; he didn’t be-
lieve it until he saw it done on the field. 

The record was made by teamwork. The 
tractor — a crawler type — moved at high gear 
with a specially stepped-up motor. The com-
bine operator had installed a special cooling 
system for her motor, and had trained herself 
to hear all parts of the machine from her post 
on the bridge. The serving truck loaded while 
moving alongside the moving combine. They 
ran on strict schedule: one minute to load, five 
minutes to deliver to the grain point a mile and 
a half away, four minutes to return. Drivers 
and operators changed places at the end of 
shifts without stopping the machinery. Projec-
tors and floodlights made night work as easy 
as day work. After the run the combine was 
found in good condition, except that it had 
shaken off bolts. The record makers were de-
vising new attachments for taking on gasoline 
and oil without stopping the machines. These 
women had been illiterate farmhands a few 
years before. 
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Achievement Wins Honours 
People like this get elected to the highest 

government bodies. Two hundred and sixty-
one were deputies in the Constitutional Con-
gress which adopted the new national constitu-
tion in 1936. There they listed themselves as 
“combine-operators, tractor-drivers, pig-rais-
ers, dairy managers, cotton-pickers, sugar-beet 
raisers” and the like. In earlier congresses 
farmers had listed themselves under the old 
peasant term of “bread growers.” Farm spe-
cialization had established itself. 

Among them was the sugar-beet celebrity, 
Maria Demchenko, who started the movement 
for raising twenty tons of beets per acre. Ma-
ria’s brigade had hoed the fields nine times, 
cleared them of moths eight times, fought 
drought with the aid of the local fire depart-
ment, which poured thousands of buckets of 
water on the fields. Yet, the following year 
Christina Baidich, mother of four children, 
doubled the record to forty tons per acre! She 
too, sat in the Constitutional Congress. There 
was also Kovardak, the Kazakh girl, who 
ploughed 12,812 acres in a single year with her 
caterpillar tractor, and Rakhmatov, not long 
since a half-starved Uzbek farmhand, who, as 
brigade-leader on a cooperative cotton farm, 
raised the yield from the usual Uzbek standard 
of 1-3/5 bales per acre to the incredible figure 
of 16 bales. In 1929 the cotton yield in the 
USSR was at the American average of about 
2/5 of a bale per acre. In 1937, the average So-
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viet yield had doubled, while the record-win-
ning Republic — that of the yellow-skinned 
Kirghiz — had an average yield of 2-4/5 bales 
per acre. Since “Kirghiz” cotton is almost all 
grown on irrigated land, the fair comparison 
here would be with California cotton, also 
largely irrigated, which averages 1 to 1-1/3 
bales per acre. 

The Better Life 
Better farm methods, as exemplified by the 

pace-setting record breakers noted above, 
were reflected also in increased income. Col-
lective farm earnings grew from 4,568,000,000 
rubles in 1932 to 18,798,000,000 in 1938. 
These figures mean little to Americans; too 
many factors have to be considered for these 
rubles to be translatable into dollars. They 
were translatable into silk dresses, perfumes, 
musical instruments, bicycles, cameras, pho-
nographs, alarm clocks, radios which appeared 
in increasing profusion in Russian villages 
where formerly even bedsheets and table 
dishes were rarely seen. Purchases of clothing 
and household goods doubled in the farm ar-
eas between 1932 and 1938; purchases of “cul-
tural goods” such as books and musical instru-
ments increased fivefold. I have met Russian 
farm families who built a new house out of two 
or three harvests. These purchases are made 
through the trading cooperatives, which have 
40 million members, and carry on all the trade 
of rural Russia. 
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In peacetime collective farmers go in for a 
good deal of travel. They are not tied by year-
round work as on the family farm. They take 
vacations, usually in winter. The big health re-
sorts of the Crimea and Caucasus — in the 
years before the present war — made extensive 
winter reservations for the collective farms. 

Part of the farmers’ income goes for music, 
art, drama, study of all kinds. Almost every 
farm has its drama group and music circle, and 
most farmers study something. The farms have 
95,275 rural club buildings, used for lectures, 
concerts and dramatic performances. Amateur 
groups produce modern plays, Russian and 
foreign classics such as Moliere and Shake-
speare. There are 13,000 well-equipped scien-
tific laboratories on collective farms, besides 
tens of thousands of small “cottage laborato-
ries.” 

Thus the farmers tie in with the educational 
movements of the nation. The farm laborato-
ries are outposts of the experimental work of 
the Commissariat of Agriculture, planning the 
farming of a continent. The music circles have 
connections with conservatories of music in 
the cities and leading conservatories have 
branches in the farming sections. Theatre 
troupes from large centres tour the farm thea-
tres. Amateur dramatic and musical groups 
from the farms take part in great folk festivals 
through which the art of the land is inter-
changed. Talented children, discovered 
through these festivals, get scholarships in the 
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Moscow Conservatory of Music or in training 
schools of world-renowned Moscow theatres. 

Thus through collective farming the medi-
eval Russian peasant became in less than a dec-
ade a scientific farmer, a reader of books and 
listener to radio — a citizen of the modern 
world. 

No More “Country vs. Town” 
But these achievements were not secured 

by the farmers in isolation. They were attained 
with the help of the industrial workers and the 
government in the “cooperating country” that 
Russia has become. 

From the beginning, Soviet leaders set out 
to eradicate the age-old antagonism between 
the farmers and the city workers. Hitler used 
this antagonism to build his Nazi-fascism, 
gaining the support of farmers through their 
suspicion of city workers. This suspicion even 
exists to a certain extent in America, though 
the traditional antagonism is not as deep-
rooted. In tsarist Russia the antagonism was 
very great. Soviet leaders broke it down by a 
system of get-together activities and mutual 
help. This could be done because, with jointly 
owned wealth, the interests of farmers and city 
workers do not conflict. Mechanics volunteer-
ing to repair farm tractors know that they are 
not helping a few farmers get rich at the ex-
pense of others, but— through collective farm-
ing — are increasing the wealth of the nation, 
so that they themselves will get more food and 
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clothes. 
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VII. FARMING A CONTINENT 

The Soviet Union develops all its produc-
tive resources, both of farms and of factory, by 
joint planning. The Five-Year Plans applied to 
agriculture as well as industry, and collective 
farming gave the farmers an active share in this 
planning. It became possible to farm the conti-
nent as a whole, much as one man farms his 
family acres. 

The “Farm Plan” 
Farming a continent starts with the “Farm 

Plan” in each local collective farm. This is a 
formidable document of twenty or thirty 
printed pages, accompanied by elaborate 
charts, discussed in detail with government ex-
perts and then adopted by the general meeting 
of the farm membership. Its adoption takes 
commonly several months of discussion and 
amendment, usually the winter months. When 
adopted, approved by the county and regis-
tered with the county authorities, it has the 
force of law, and becomes the basis on which 
the nationwide plans are built. The local farm’s 
success is thenceforth judged by the extent to 
which it fulfils or surpasses its Plan. 

The “Plan” begins with a survey of the 
farm’s lands and their general nature. Then 
come the farm’s people, number of families, of 
able-bodied workers, old folks and children, 
and the expected normal population increase 
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through births for many years to come. This is 
followed by the number of all kinds of live-
stock and their expected increase, by natural 
means and by purchase. The reason for this is 
that the farm plans to supply its members and 
their livestock with basic food, in addition to 
its cash crops. Questions of the amount of land 
to be sown to cash crops are taken up with the 
government, and are decided on the basis of an 
adjustment between the government’s de-
mands from this particular region and the con-
ditions of the individual farm. 

On the basis of all this, the Plan fixes the 
crop rotation, considers the number of work-
days needed in comparison with the able-bod-
ied members, and takes up projects of perma-
nent improvement to utilize surplus labour 
power. 

The Machine and Tractor Station 
The connection between collective farms is 

supplied by that unique institution, the Ma-
chine and Tractor Station, which came into ex-
istence in 1930 out of the dire need of farms for 
machinery which they were unable to buy and 
incompetent to use. 

I saw the first of these stations in January 
of that year. On the boundless steppe not far 
from Odessa stood a giant machine-shop sur-
rounded by garages holding 200 tractors, with 
full complement of tractor-drawn machines. 
White cottages housed mechanics and working 
personnel. This station was the centre of 
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power-farming for one hundred and fifty thou-
sand acres. It supplied machines on contract to 
sixty-seven villages. 

The sixty-seven villages were of four na-
tionalities: Russian, Ukrainian, German and 
Jewish. They had different methods and prob-
lems and made different contracts with the 
MTS. A German farm at Naikova, had plenty 
of horses, but used tractors to break virgin soil. 
A new Jewish collective at Felix, used tractors 
for most operations. Each farm paid in grain 
after harvest for the machine-power used. 
Charges were reckoned at cost, for the MTS 
was self-supporting, but not profit-making. 
Tractors went in spring to the villages and re-
turned to the MTS in winter for over-hauling. 
Each tractor had two or three full-time drivers, 
who kept their machines going night and day. 
Thus all these sixty-seven villages, with differ-
ent needs and methods, were knit into one 
great power-farming system by the MTS. 

The Machine and Tractor Station became 
at once a district agricultural headquarters. It 
served as such for farm experts touring the vil-
lages to help in crop rotation plans. It became 
the centre for winter courses for farmers. It be-
came the centre for farm credits. In its very 
first year the MTS near Odessa was buying se-
lected seed and importing French vines, young 
apple trees, pure-bred cows, sheep, pigs and 
chickens for the sixty-seven villages it served. 

By 1937, a network of thousands of MTS 
covered the country, servicing practically all 
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the collective farms with machine power. 
This system gave the farmers machine-

power handled by experts, without heavy over-
head, and payable in kind at harvest. It gave 
the government an annual grain income with-
out middlemen, in return for the use of ma-
chines. 

By 1937 the shortage of machine power 
was over. Half a million tractors brought 
power farming to all the collective farm fields. 
This is only about a third as many as in the 
United States, but Russian tractors average 
2500 hours of work annually, as against an av-
erage American use of 400 to 600 hours per 
year. “Hardly more than the productivity of a 
horse,” say the Russians, shocked at the idle-
ness of precious machinery on American fam-
ily-sized farms. Russian machines workday 
and night, and specialize on the heavier opera-
tions, leaving lighter work to horses. In 1938 
tractors did 71.5 percent of all the ploughing 
and 56.7 percent of all the sowing, as against 
one percent of the ploughing and two-tenths 
percent of the sowing ten years before. 

The increase of harvester-combines has 
been even more spectacular. The first appeared 
in North Caucasus in 1925. Fourteen years 
later Russia was using 168,000, more than 
twice as many as were being used in all the rest 
of the world. Outside the USSR the chief user 
of combines is the United States, which has 
somewhat more than 60,000. Germany, France 
and England together have less than two hun-
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dred. In Russia half the total grain acreage is 
harvested by combines, while over 95 percent 
is harvested by some kind of complex machine. 

“Russia and America Farm” 
“Russia and America farm; the little na-

tions of Europe garden,” was the judgement 
passed by an American grain farmer who made 
a survey of European agriculture. 

Ten years ago the Russian harvester-com-
bine copied the American. Today the Russians 
make their own, with many improvements. 
Theirs is sturdier than ours, more expensive at 
first cost, built for maximum steady use. It is 
developed by constant experiment. One sum-
mer I met in the Soviet harvest fields a scien-
tific expedition testing forty-five new varieties 
of harvesting machines, many of which were 
the result of farmers’ suggestions. The expedi-
tion comprised 10 scientists, 12 economists, 15 
agricultural experts, 100 engineers and techni-
cians and more than a hundred machine oper-
ators. It was only one of four such expeditions 
in the grain harvest that year. These experts 
tested every proposed machine, as a whole and 
in every part, for durability, productivity, op-
erating costs and effect on crops. The tests de-
termined what machines should go into mass 
production the following year. 

Under the tsar, Russia was subject to fre-
quent famine; in twenty years from 1890 to 
1910 her statisticians counted four good har-
vests, thirteen poor harvests, three famine 
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years. Under collective farming from 1933 on-
ward, every harvest was higher than the kind 
formerly accounted good. The best pre-revolu-
tionary harvests reached 80,000,000 metric 
tons of grain, but even dry years after 1933 
gave over 90,000,000 tons, while 1937, a year 
of good weather, gave the spectacular total of 
113,000,000 metric tons of grain. 

Leading the World 
President Kalinin once stated that in indus-

trial production the Soviet Union copies the 
technique of more advanced nations. “But in 
farming we are leaders on a new road. Here we 
go before all nations!” 

This proud boast is borne out by many con-
crete facts. Nowhere is scientific discovery in 
farming more active than in the USSR. One 
plant specialist has developed a variety of per-
ennial wheat, which planted in the autumn of 
193g, produced four crops in two years with a 
total of 83 bushels per acre. Other specialists 
developed “vernalization,” a way of treating 
seed so that it goes into the ground almost 
sprouted and ripens very much earlier. By this 
method winter wheat can be planted in spring, 
while other kinds of grain can be brought to 
harvest before the deadly summer winds of 
Russia’s dry areas. 

Aviation in farming is one spectacular new 
development. This began in the first stages of 
collective farming, when farm newspapers sent 
out small educational airplanes. The Peasants’ 
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Gazette maintained five such planes which 
worked their way north in sowing and harvest, 
landing on the farm fields to spread word of 
new methods. 

By 1934 a Farm Aviation Trust operated 
twelve months a year, sowing pine trees in Jan-
uary snows of Siberia, sowing sand oats in de-
serts to bind the sand, sowing extra-early grain 
in dry regions direct into melting snow and soft 
mud where tractors could not travel, sowing 
rice in North Caucasus, fighting plant pests, 
forest pests and malarial mosquitoes on a tre-
mendous scale. Farm aviation takes day-old 
chicks from incubator stations to farms a hun-
dred miles away; it carries tomato and cabbage 
seedlings that are started in the warm Black 
Sea region, to ripen near Moscow or Lenin-
grad. One major task is pest-fighting. In 1933 
airplanes cleared a million acres of malarial 
mosquitoes by dusting swamps with Paris 
green; and in the same year cleared 800,000 
acres of grasshoppers and 127,000 acres of boll 
weevil. 

Moving Back the Desert 
As exciting as farm aviation is the reclama-

tion of great deserts that lie between Europe 
and Asia. Years ago, when I lay sick with ty-
phus in the Volga famine of 1921, I read in H. 
G. Wells’ “Outline of History” that all this re-
gion is slowly and inevitably drying up in the 
long retreat of earth’s Glacial Age. It sounded 
as fated as the march of the stars and the cir-
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cling of planets. 
Soviet scientists today have challenged this 

inevitability. They are moving the desert back. 
A great belt of trees hundreds of miles long has 
been planted to shield Southeastern Europe 
from the hot desert winds. In regions where 
over-grazing disintegrates the dusty soil, the 
government regulates pasturage. Hardy plants 
have been developed whose deep roots pierce 
far down to subsoil moisture these are sown 
from the air to bind the sands. By all these 
means one of the worst dustbowls of Asia is 
being brought back to soil stability. Our “shel-
ter belt” of trees and soil conservation 
measures are bringing similar results in Amer-
ica. 

New and picturesque farm practices have 
developed in the -dry regions. One of these is 
snow-retention, widely practised on the grain 
farms of the Trans-Volga steppe. The scanty 
winter snows, almost the only moisture of this 
region, are kept from blowing away by fences, 
and by ploughing the snow in winter at right 
angles to the wind. Soviet farmers even grow 
wheat in parts of the desolate Karakum Desert. 
Three varieties have been developed which can 
be grown where rainfall does not exceed 1.9 
inches per year. 

Trench-planting is another method of de-
sert-farming. It was found that many seem-
ingly waterless areas have reserves of moisture 
some distance below the surface. Trenches 
with sloping sides were dug and a thin layer of 
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humus soil placed on the bottom, in which 
crops were planted. The trenches protect the 
plants from winds; they are also cooler by day 
and warmer by night than the open desert. Po-
tatoes, cabbage, tomatoes, onions, eggplant, 
carrots, melons are among the vegetables that 
have been thus grown. Even orchards and vine-
yards have been laid out in such trenches, fur-
ther protected by barriers of poplar and tama-
risk trees. 

Irrigation, of course, is widely used in the 
dry regions. In- Central Asia it is of ancient 
origin, but enthusiastic collective farmers have 
extended it very widely by their winter labours, 
in addition to the great canals that the govern-
ment has built. Elsewhere it has been intro-
duced for special emergencies. I recall the dry 
summer in Kabardino-Balkaria, a small state 
of the North Caucasus, when men and women 
turned out to dig hundreds of miles of ditches 
to the mountain torrents, using the enthusias-
tic slogan: “We have mountains; we don’t need 
rain!” The most ambitious irrigation project 
plans to divert the Amu Darya, one of Asia’s 
great rivers, back to its ancient channel, where 
deep silt awaits the quickening touch of water 
to become richer than the valley of the Nile. 

Conquering the Arctic with Farms 
The farm achievement most famed outside 

the Soviet Union is the conquest of the Arctic, 
where the celebrated northern farms create a 
food base for the strategically important Great 
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Northern Sea Route along the Arctic Coast of 
Europe and Asia. The last of the Russian tsars 
sent an adjutant to investigate the possibilities 
of the Arctic. He reported: “Farming, like 
every other pursuit, is impossible in this eter-
nal night.” The Soviet people attacked the Arc-
tic as a national adventure. They invented spe-
cial airplanes to scout its areas. They set up 
weather stations along the Arctic coast. 
Trained men went north with stump-pulling 
machines, bush-cutters, bog-ploughs to clear 
the jungles. Scientists developed special plants 
for the north. 

Crops are raised today where once the rein-
deer was not sure of surviving. The most nor-
therly farm in the world is a Soviet farm lying 
,200 miles beyond the Arctic Circle. A rust-
proof potato has been grown whose leaves are 
green at nine degrees below freezing. Dozens 
of agricultural stations raise wheat, oats, bar-
ley, potatoes and many vegetables in polar re-
gions, and have extended their work in war-
time. In 1942 new varieties of flax, hemp and 
sugar beets were planted in the northern sta-
tions with success. 

Russia’s collective farms have transformed 
a continent in the past ten years in accordance 
with a plan. Wheat, rice and cotton moved 
north io new areas; potatoes, a cold country 
crop, were trained to move south. Transporta-
tion problems were cut by developing self-suf-
ficient areas. New crops were introduced, such 
as citrus fruits, tea, and rubber bearing plants. 
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Rubber a New Crop 
An outstanding example of the introduc-

tion of a new crop is the cultivation of natural 
rubber from a weed that formerly grew wild in 
the mountains of Central Asia. 

Interest in the possibilities of natural rub-
ber production began with the first plans for 
the industrialization of the Soviet Union. For 
modern industry is unthinkable without rub-
ber. It is essential in the chemical industries, in 
electricity, and in automotive and aircraft pro-
duction. 

There were no home sources of supply, and 
the rubber output that virtually the whole 
world drew upon came from the East Indies 
and Southeast Asia. As this war has shown, 
these sources could be cut off by an aggressor 
power. 

To meet this problem, the Soviet Govern-
ment embarked on two ventures — the manu-
facture of synthetic rubber and the planting of 
crops yielding rubber. 

In synthetic rubber production the Soviets 
have had especially outstanding success. 

However, synthetic rubber remains more 
expensive than natural rubber and is not as sat-
isfactory for a number of industrial uses. 
Therefore, Soviet industry has turned to native 
kauchhonossi or rubber-bearing plants, the 
search for which began simultaneously with 
the research in synthetic rubber. In the search 
for natural rubber, known plants from abroad 
were cultivated and studied, but it was the na-
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tive plants that gave the best results. 
On January 17, 1931, there came into being 

a committee of scientists, one of whose chief 
movers was Academician N. I. Vavilov. Under 
the direction of this committee the rubber hunt 
was turned into a directed and coordinated na-
tionwide research. 

In the next three years some thirty major 
expeditions were organized which collected 
and studied nearly 5,000 specimens. These 
came from over 1,000 species belonging to 316 
plant genera. Of the nearly 5,000 specimens 
collected, over 600 contained at least a trace of 
rubber. The plant now being cultivated, kok 
sagyz, was discovered by an expedition headed 
by one Bukhanevich, a worker in a Moscow 
aniline dye factory. 

Thirteen farms undertook the experimental 
cultivation of kok sagyz and other plants dis-
covered, and imported plants like the Mexican 
guayule and the dandelion seed developed in 
this country by Edison. Research institutions 
in rubber planting were organized at Moscow 
and Margoshev, with branches in the Ukraine, 
the Caucasus and Central Asia. 

By 1935 the Department had produced 
enough seeds and plants to cover the following 
acreages: 4,270 acres to kok sagyz; 2,770 acres 
to tau sagyz; 1,300 to guayule; 800 acres to a 
plant called vatochnik; and 320 acres to a plant 
called evkommia. 

Actually the plantings that year were the fi-
nal stage of a battle of the species. The winner 
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was kok sagyz. 
Large-scale planting of kok sagyz had begun 

in 1933 and from this large-scale planting in-
formation had poured in. The scientifically 
minded, practical farmers on the Soviet collec-
tives poured in reports to the research centres, 
supplying data which would have taken long 
years to work out in the laboratories. 

It is such collaboration between planter in 
the field and researcher in the field station that 
made kok sagyz, like other Soviet agricultural 
triumphs, possible. Among the great names in 
the development of kok sagyz, are those of plain 
people like the Moscow dye worker Bukha-
nevich; the collective farm chairman, Shkorov; 
the woman collective farm brigade leader, Pan-
nuzina. 

It was found that the rubber in kok sagyz 
averaged four and one-half percent of the root 
weight; that it can be extracted the first year 
after growth, which makes it highly important 
in the war emergency years; and that the rub-
ber content gains both in quantity and quality 
if the root is permitted another one or two 
years’ growth. So far, the best method found 
for extraction is to dry the root, powder it and 
then by gravity or centrifuging, separating the 
rubber out in a water or alkaline solution. 

These methods are so similar to beet sugar 
extraction that it has been possible to turn 
sugar mills into rubber mills overnight. In this 
respect also, kok sagyz fitted conveniently into 
the wartime picture. 
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As the war crisis approached, the im-
portance of rubber was recognized in the es-
tablishment of a new, special commissariat de-
voted to extending rubber production, both 
synthetic and natural. Established in 1941, the 
new commissariat was headed by Tikhon 
Borisovich Mitrokhin. 

By that time kok sagyz had become an im-
portant crop. In 1941, 170,000 acres were un-
der kok sagyz and the plan for 1942 called for a 
million acres. Under the war impetus, the acre-
age total has probably been exceeded. 

In 1941 the average yield per acre was 
thirty pounds, but yields as high as 150 pounds 
had been obtained. As seed stocks and cultiva-
tion methods are improved, higher figures may 
be expected. 

These results have been put at the disposal 
of its allies by the Soviet government. 

Kok sagyz seed has been sent by plane to 
America and Canada, to New Zealand, Aus-
tralia, India and Great Britain. 

In England the plant is being intensively 
studied in experimental plantings in the Royal 
Botanical Gardens at Kew, and seed is being 
distributed for experimental plantings in 
twenty other localities throughout the British 
Isles to test the growth in every variety of soil 
and climatic conditions on the islands. 

Thus kok sagyz is acting in its own way as a 
binder in the solidarity of the United Nations. 
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VIII. RESTORING THE LIBER-

ATED AREAS 

We have seen how the collective farms in 
the front-line districts met the test of war. We 
have seen how the collective farms in the rest 
of the country won the battle against famine. 
The greatest miracle of all has been the swift 
return to life of the ravaged Ukrainian fields, 
almost completely liberated in the spring of 
1944. The guerrilla fighters who left their 
ploughs for guns are back at their ploughs 
again, turning up long furrows of earth mixed 
now with the blood and the bones of their 
brothers. Far in the rear the farmers who 
fought the battle of production so heroically 
took on without question the added task of 
sharing their machinery and their cattle with 
those who have started life anew in the reoccu-
pied areas. 

On August 21, 1943, at the height of the 
Red Army’s summer offensive, a decree was is-
sued outlining in detail measures for the resto-
ration of liberated territory covering 272,150 
square miles. These measures were to be car-
ried out by the federal and local government in 
cooperation with the people themselves. 

The Plan Is Made 
The steps outlined in this decree were ad-

mirably summarized by E. C. Ropes in the For-
eign Commerce Weekly for April 22, 1944, as 
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follows: 
I. Return to the collective farms of the live-

stock evacuated to the East. 
II. The per capita increase of livestock on 

the farms of the liberated areas. 
III. The restoration of poultry raising on 

the collective farms. 
IV. Exemptions in connection with deliver-

ies of agricultural products to the state. 
V. Relief in seed for farms for the fall plant-

ing of 1943. 
VI. Restoration of machine-tractor sta-

tions and machine-tractor repair shops. 
VII. Assistance in the restoration and 

building of dwellings for farmers, etc. 
VIII. Restoration of railroad stations, rail-

road sheds and other structures. 
IX. Grant of allotment garden plots and ex-

emption from obligatory deliveries for railroad 
workers. 

X. The organization for children of soldiers 
and guerrillas, and for orphans of the German 
occupation, of military schools, trade schools, 
children’s homes, and receiving and distrib-
uting stations. 

Exact steps were worked out for the fulfil-
ment of each of these points. 

As regards the restocking of these areas 
with cattle, livestock evacuated eastward and 
their progeny in the intervening period were to 
be returned together with additional livestock 
to be supplied from the unoccupied areas. The 
totals amounted to 197,166 cattle, 341,421 
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sheep and goats, and 52,939 horses. 
Measures were outlined for the transporta-

tion of the livestock, erection of transfer sta-
tions, veterinary inspection on arrival and dis-
tribution to the farms left destitute by the re-
treating Germans. Provision of cows to indi-
vidual collective farm members was arranged 
for with equal care. For the restoration of poul-
try farms 500,000 breeding birds and 9,600,000 
incubator chicks were to be provided by the 
Government. Simultaneous provisions were 
made for building materials to construct new 
hatcheries and for fuel to run them. Other 
points were similarly worked out to the last de-
tail. 

Achievement Report 
On February 5, 1944, the committee 

charged with the supervision of this work pub-
lished a report of its successful fulfilment, 
which is an amazing record of achievements in 
reconstruction carried on in the midst of the 
greatest battles of all time. 

The plan for the partial restoration of live-
stock was more than fulfilled. In order to un-
derstand the restoration measures in livestock, 
the extent of the devastation must be under-
stood. For, disastrous as the Nazi invasion was 
to crops, it was even more so to livestock. This 
is made clear in a recent article on agricultural 
rehabilitation by Lazar Volin and Sylvia Good-
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stein.1 
In the districts of the Ukraine liberated by 

late autumn, 1943, there remained only 6.5 
percent of the pre-war number of horses, 6.2 
percent of the cattle and 1.8 percent of the 
sheep. The total amount of cattle successfully 
evacuated was not large. 

Within less than a half a year over 1,723,00 
head of cattle, including the re-evacuated, were 
restored to the liberated areas. To these were 
added more than 880,000 calves purchased by 
the Government from the east-central regions 
of the USSR. Many thousands more were con-
tributed by the farmers themselves in the east-
ern regions. 

Collective farms also received more than 
1,600,000 cubic metres of timber for the resto-
ration of farm buildings. The returned herds of 
cattle were well-housed during the winter as a 
result. And in order to provide trained man-
power to handle them and ensure the healthy 
development of the livestock, 71 schools for 
veterinarians and their assistants and for spe-
cialists in animal husbandry were set up, five 
above plan. These schools graduated 8,402 ex-
perts. 

The exemptions provided for collective 
farms as a whole and for individual farm fami-
lies, either releasing them wholly from the ob-
ligation of making state deliveries, or reducing 

 
1 See “The USSR in Reconstruction,” American Rus-

sian Institute, New York, 1944. 
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their quotas, were carried out according to the 
plan. 

The provision for the distribution of seed 
for fall sowing fell a trifle short of fulfilment, 
but even so almost 100,000 metric tons of seed 
were allocated. 

The plan for restoring the ruined machine 
and tractor stations was carried out with par-
ticular success. The number restored was 575, 
and 978 repair shops were set up. Over six 
thousand1 evacuated tractors were returned 
(there were 90,000 tractors in the Ukraine in 
1940), as well as other necessary farm machin-
ery and implements, in excess of the plan pro-
posed. Along with these went building materi-
als, spare parts, fuel, lubricants, and skilled la-
bour. The latter included not only 3,587 
trained farm workers and specialists returned 
to their homes, but 600 new farm school grad-
uates assigned to the most needy districts. 

New housing was especially vital because 
of the systematic demolition carried out by the 
retreating Germans who, when they had time, 
razed villages completely to the ground. The 
houses newly constructed or reconstructed 
numbered 326,461 in towns and workers’ set-
tlements, and 266,050 in the villages. This en-
abled more than 1,500,000 people to move 
from dugouts and damaged buildings into live-

 
1 By June 1944, it was reported that since the expul-

sion of the invaders the liberated regions had received over 
22,000 tractors. 
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able dwellings. To facilitate construction, local 
plants to manufacture building materials were 
set up according to plan, and building loans up 
to 10,000 rubles to each family were made by 
the Agricultural Bank. No less imposing are 
the figures relating to the restoration of railway 
buildings, stations and homes for railroad 
workers. 

Special trade schools were started in the 
liberated areas accommodating 9,000 children. 
In addition, nine Suvorov military schools and 
children’s homes accommodating more than 
14,000 orphaned youngsters were opened. 

The best available buildings were turned 
over for the use of these children’s homes. The 
collective farmers contributed building materi-
als, food supplies and household goods. Thou-
sands of acres of land were allotted to the 
schools on which they are growing their own 
food supplies. 

Helping Hands from Afar 
One of the most striking aspects of this 

whole process of restoration is the way in 
which collective farms in the interior have vol-
untarily taken upon themselves the additional 
burden of sharing their machinery, their live-
stock and their products, so greatly needed by 
themselves, with those whose need is still 
greater. From all over the country supplemen-
tary aid, over and above that provided for in 
the plan, has been pouring in a steady stream 
into the liberated areas. 



 

111 

A favourite method for carrying this out is 
for whole regions to take patronage over the 
collective farms of a specified area. In many 
cases, a collective farm will take the responsi-
bility of helping to get a specified collective 
farm on its feet. The three southern republics 
of Tadzhikistan, Georgia and Azerbaidzhan, 
which are high on the government honours list 
for their farm work during the war, have been 
in the forefront of this movement. Georgia, for 
example, has taken patronage over all the col-
lective farms of the Stavropol and Krasnodar 
regions. This means that not only are they 
sending everything they can to help now, but 
they are cultivating additional plots whose 
products will be sent them later. 

The farmers of the liberated regions have 
in turn proved themselves worthy of this gen-
erosity. To the rich Kuban section of the Kras-
nodar region, for example, where planting 
must be completed by April 15, spring came 
late in 1944, and the whole plan for ploughing 
and sowing was threatened. The area had been 
stripped so bare by the Germans that almost 
all the seed planted had to be sent in from out-
side. Heavy rains turned the roads to bogs; but 
when trucks and carts stalled and floundered, 
the peasants themselves carried millions of 
pounds of seed grain to the fields on their 
backs in order that the sowing should be com-
pleted on time — and it was. And over the 
whole Ukraine this spring, there was not a sin-
gle collective farm that didn’t accomplish mir-
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acles. In the war-desolated southern Ukraine 
the plan was exceeded by 12 percent. 

By June 1, 1944, the area sown to grain 
crops in the USSR as a whole exceeded the 
1943 area by about 15,000,000 acres; in vege-
tables and potatoes by 2,500,000 acres. (Later 
figures indicated an increase of 30,000,000 
acres in grain over last year.) 

Soviet cultural workers are doing their part 
in the restoration of agriculture. The Soviet 
Government Art Committee organized concert 
and dramatic groups that toured the villages to 
help provide relaxation and keep up the morale 
of the farm workers as they toiled. 

Maurice Hindus wrote recently of the ines-
timable contribution that is being made by 
women on the farms. Visiting the collectives in 
the Moscow province, Hindus was walking 
along a country road at midnight with a Soviet 
county agent, who pointed to a light in the dis-
tance and said: 

“That’s a girl operating her tractor by 
torchlight. Her crews are pledged to work 
2,470 acres of land this season, with 15 HP 
tractor equipment, so it keeps the tractor going 
day and night... Never before in this region did 
any tractor crew make such a high pledge. 
That’s more than three times the pre-war aver-
age.” 

Where they haven’t tractors, they use 
horses, and even cows are being broken in to 
harness and used for ploughing and sowing. 
Some of the correspondents have written of 
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seeing human beings themselves trying to pull 
ploughs. 

New parts for tractors have been coming 
from the ruined Kharkov tractor plant since 
last November, just three months after the lib-
eration of Kharkov. It is being restored with 
almost incredible speed. Its shattered ma-
chines, dug from the ruins are being rebuilt and 
by the end of the year will be turning out com-
plete tractors again. Meantime hundreds of 
new workers are being trained for skilled jobs 
in the plant when it is in production again. 

Specialists and Their Skills 
A special concern of the government plan-

ning organizations has been the supplying of a 
sufficient number of agricultural specialists 
and skilled workers to the liberated areas. The 
director of the employment bureau of the Peo-
ple’s Commissariat of Agriculture has been 
swamped with requests from Central Asia, Si-
beria, the Urals and other sections of the So-
viet Union, from specialists and others eager 
to help in the rehabilitation program. 

The problem is being met chiefly through a 
training program. During the winter of 1943-
44, 3,000,000 collective farmers took intensive 
courses in scientific agriculture. Many thou-
sands of experts were thus turned out by agri-
cultural colleges all over the country. The agri-
cultural colleges in the Rostov, Stalingrad, 
Krasnodar, Voronezh, Kharkov, Orel and 
other freed regions are being swiftly re-estab-
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lished, so that local people may be trained. 
Moscow’s agricultural colleges have orga-

nized special “refresher” courses for farmers 
from the liberated areas who are being re-
turned from the fighting lines to their fields. 
They must learn new skills — how to restore 
fertility to soil that has been reduced to barren 
desert, to once rich fields now weed-ridden and 
torn by bombs and shells and trenches. Even 
the soil which the invaders tried to cultivate 
has deteriorated through the primitive meth-
ods applied by the Germans, and the sabotage 
practised by the Russians who refused to be 
serfs. 

Articles in the Soviet press indicate that the 
demands of reconstruction are creating new 
and higher standards of work for specialists. 
The former tendency which sometimes ap-
peared toward over-emphasis on paperwork 
and voluminous reports, is swiftly disappear-
ing. 

Thus, the gigantic plan for 1944 is well un-
derway in all the liberated areas, as well as in 
the rear, providing for greatly extended seeded 
areas. Some of the crops which have “changed 
addresses,” that is, been introduced into new 
areas, have so liked their new homes that they 
remain. Elsewhere they are being returned to 
their old homes. In 1943 the yields of all crops 
but grain were above those of 1942, while pro-
duction of vegetables and potatoes was above 
that of any pre-war year. Due to the extent of 
the devastation and the shortage of manpower 



 

115 

and draft power on the farms, there can be no 
thought as yet of reaching prewar acreage or 
productivity. But this year will show great in-
creases in all crops, as the good Soviet land is 
returned to those who own and love it. 

The Farms Beat Hitler 
In this pamphlet, I have tried to describe 

the new, modern type of farming that Hitler 
encountered in his attempt to conquer the So-
viet Union and then use its resources to con-
quer the world. 

On the battlefields, Hitler’s Wehrmacht 
faced masters of mechanized war who had 
been trained on the Soviet Union’s mechanized 
farms and factories. In the less known battle of 
hunger the integrated, collective farm system 
overcame the Nazi seizure of about a third of 
its food growing areas. The resourcefulness 
shown is little short of miraculous. The Soviet 
farmers won the battle of hunger. That victory 
was as decisive in its own way as the Battle of 
Stalingrad. 
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